

# **EXHIBIT 2**

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Rate	Time	Total
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Telephone call with potential client Ms. Esparza.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
5/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Shawn Esparza Client Intake, including supporting text message documents provided by potential	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft client retention agreement for Shawn Esparza	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Research prior cases against SmartPay including potential arbitration issues in preparation for drafting complaint	\$ 575.00	2.7	\$ 1,552.50
5/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Research SmartPay's business practices, locations, and publicly available terms and conditions	\$ 525.00	0.8	\$ 420.00
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Commence first draft complaint.	\$ 575.00	2.7	\$ 1,552.50
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Research company and review SmartPay website for all agreements to be signed by customers in preparation to draft complaint.	\$ 575.00	2.6	\$ 1,495.00
5/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding phone call from potential client Shawn Esparza asking if we are going to pursue her case.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding phone call from potential client Shawn Esparza asking if we are going to pursue her case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding phone call from potential client Shawn Esparza asking if we are going to pursue her case.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding sending a retainer to Shawn Esparza and setting up the case folder on database.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding sending a retainer to Shawn Esparza and setting up the case folder on database.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding sending a retainer to Shawn Esparza and setting up the case folder on database.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file and contact information for Shawn Esparza.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file and contact information for Shawn Esparza.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file and contact information for Shawn Esparza.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding introductory phone call and attached retainer agreement and class duties letter.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file being opened on database.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file being opened on database.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding case file being opened on database.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding follow up on retention agreement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding printing the retention agreement, signing and mailing back once she has printer ink.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding resending the retainer agreement because she couldn't find the original email.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding the attached retention agreement as requested.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding mailing out the signed retention agreement to our office.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding our office receiving the signed retention agreement and that the complaint will be ready soon.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding keeping an eye our for the draft complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding the attached draft complaint for review and to pay extra attention to the entitled factual allegations.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding preparing the case initiating documents and possible day to file.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/10/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding preparing the case initiating documents and possible day to file.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding preparing the case initiating documents and possible day to file.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding assignment to prepare case initiating documents.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding assignment to prepare case initiating documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/10/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding assignment to prepare case initiating documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit draft of complaint against SmartPay Leasing on behalf of Shawn Esparza	\$ 785.00	0.9	\$ 706.50
6/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Edit complaint with additional text messages provided by Plaintiff	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
6/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the attached draft civil cover sheet and summons for review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the attached draft civil cover sheet and summons for review.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the attached draft civil cover sheet and summons for review.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Meeting with KG and RM regarding case strategy and class definition, strengths and weaknesses	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
6/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with AW and RM regarding case strategy and class definition, strengths and weaknesses	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
6/13/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Meeting with KG and AW regarding case strategy and class definition, strengths and weaknesses	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
6/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Finalize complaint for filing, including civil cover sheet and proposed summons	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
6/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #1	\$ 215.00	0.6	\$ 129.00
6/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #2	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding whether she had a chance to review the draft complaint or not.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Notice of Case Assignment to Magistrate Judge Joseph C. Spero	\$ 575.00	0.1	\$ 57.50
6/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Dkt. No. 3 - Notice of Case Assignment to Magistrate Judge Joseph C. Spero, including applicable standing orders	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
6/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review notice of case assignment to Magistrate Judge Joseph C. Spero and initial case management scheduling order	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #4	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Draft Notice of Appearance of Kas Gallucci	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	File Notice of Appearance of Alexis Wood	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #7	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar deadlines according to initial case management scheduling order.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review initial case management scheduling order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #6	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #5	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	File Kas Gallucci's Notice of Appearance	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Draft Notice of Appearance of Alexis Wood	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #3	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Initial Case Management Scheduling Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Reivew Initial Case Management Scheduleing Order, including necessary ADR documents in preparation for sending to client	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding draft complaint isn't attached to email.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding the previous email where the complaint was attached.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding client's review of draft complaint and confirming all facts look correct.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding filing the complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding final review of case initiating documents being ready to file case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding final review of case initiating documents being ready to file case.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding final review of case initiating documents being ready to file case.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft notices of appearance prepared for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft notices of appearance prepared for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft notices of appearance prepared for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/15/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding review of draft notices of appearance for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/15/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding review of draft notices of appearance for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding review of draft notices of appearance for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



6/16/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding attached case initiating documents to be served on defendant.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/16/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding attached case initiating documents to be served on defendant.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/16/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding attached case initiating documents to be served on defendant.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding summons issued by the Court and needing to send documents out for service.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding summons and complaint being sent for service, and following up with process server.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding summons and complaint being sent for service, and following up with process server.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding summons and complaint being sent for service, and following up with process server.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirming receipt of summons and complaint to be served.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirming receipt of summons and complaint to be served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirming receipt of summons and complaint to be served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding documents to be served on Smartpay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding documents to be served on Smartpay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Morris Phillips Process Server regarding receiving documents for service on Smartpay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirmation the documents were received.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirmation the documents were received.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Consent or Declination to Magistrate Judge	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding service on Smartpay being completed.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/24/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding conformed copy of complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/24/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding needing to send the summons and complaint out for service if it hasn't been.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/24/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding needing to send the summons and complaint out for service if it hasn't been.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding needing to send the summons and complaint out for service if it hasn't been.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/24/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the Court's requirements for service according to docket number 6.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/24/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the Court's requirements for service according to docket number 6.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/24/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the Court's requirements for service according to docket number 6.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the Court's requirements for service according to docket number 6.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/24/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Court's requirement to serve the brochure entitled "Consenting To A Magistrate Judge's Jurisdiction In The Northern District."	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/24/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Court's requirement to serve the brochure entitled "Consenting To A Magistrate Judge's Jurisdiction In The Northern District."	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/24/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Court's requirement to serve the brochure entitled "Consenting To A Magistrate Judge's Jurisdiction In The Northern District."	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Court's requirement to serve the brochure entitled "Consenting To A Magistrate Judge's Jurisdiction In The Northern District."	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	File magistrate judge declination	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #8	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #9	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the summons and complaint being served.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/27/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the summons and complaint being served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/27/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the summons and complaint being served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the summons and complaint being served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding rule 4-2 (d).	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/27/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding rule 4-2 (d).	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/27/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding rule 4-2 (d).	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding rule 4-2 (d).	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring service date and circulating the the deadline to respond to the complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/28/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring service date and circulating the the deadline to respond to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/28/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring service date and circulating the the deadline to respond to the complaint.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring service date and circulating the the deadline to respond to the complaint.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring the service date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/28/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring the service date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/28/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring the service date.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring the service date.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding case management and assigning a printer code to case.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Victoria Vasquez regarding printer code for case.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/29/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed order reassigning case.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
6/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Order Reassigning Case, including Judge Alsup's standing orders and potential impact on putative class action	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
6/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Reivew Order Reassigning Case to Judge Alsup	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
6/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #10	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Initial Disclosures for attorney review	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Edit Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures before service	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #11	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Telephone call with Client re: ADR certificate.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice and Order re Factors to be Evaluated for any Proposed Class.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Mike Houchin, Bill Richards, Adam Belsey from Allison Cardwell regarding notice and order on factors to be evaluated for any proposed class settlement.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Mike Houchin, Bill Richards, Adam Belsey from Allison Cardwell regarding notice and order on factors to be evaluated for any proposed class settlement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Mike Houchin, Bill Richards, Adam Belsey from Allison Cardwell regarding notice and order on factors to be evaluated for any proposed class settlement.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Mike Houchin, Bill Richards, Adam Belsey from Allison Cardwell regarding notice and order on factors to be evaluated for any proposed class settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

6/30/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Mike Houchin, Bill Richards, Adam Belsey from Allison Cardwell regarding notice and order on factors to be evaluated for any proposed class settlement.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding needing the client to sign and date first.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding needing the client to sign and date first.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding needing the client to sign and date first.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding needing client signature to ADR Certification Form.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding needing client signature to ADR Certification Form.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding needing client signature to ADR Certification Form.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



7/1/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form for client signature.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/1/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form for client signature.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/1/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft ADR Certification Form for client signature.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/4/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding ADR Certification Form.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/6/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review clerk's notice scheduling initial case management conference.	\$ 785.00	0.7	\$ 549.50
7/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #12	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendared updated CMC information per Doc. No. 12	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review notice reassigning CMC	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding updating calendar with new date for Initial CMC.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding updating calendar with new date for Initial CMC.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding updating calendar with new date for Initial CMC.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeffrey Topor regarding extension of time to respond to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Following meet and confer with defendant's counsel, finalize stipulation to continue dates, and provide signature approval on stipulation	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50

7/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's Certificate of Interested Parties, and conduct research into corporate parent and ability to pay	\$ 525.00	1.1	\$ 577.50
7/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Review stipulation to extend date to file a response.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Review certificate of interested parties for filing.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #16	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #15	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	File Plaintiff's Notice of Interested Parties	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #13	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #14	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Draft Plaintiff's Notice of Interested Parties.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
7/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed plaintiffs certificate of interested entities prior to filing.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review plaintiffs ADR Certification of discussion of ADR options prior to filing.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review certificate of interested entities filed by Smartpay Leasing, Inc	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
7/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review stipulation filed by defendant to extend time to respond to complaint.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding updated calendar per the new CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding updated calendar per the new CMC date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding updated calendar per the new CMC date.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeffrey Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff giving defendant a 2 week extension to respond to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeffrey Topor regarding draft stipulation for an extension to respond to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding draft stipulation proposed by defense for an extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding draft stipulation proposed by defense for an extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeffrey Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding approval of draft stipulation for an extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeffrey Topor regarding draft stipulation for an extension to respond to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding case management.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding case management.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding client retainer and documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding client retainer and documents.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft for review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft for review.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft for review.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding approval of draft for filing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding approval of draft for filing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding approval of draft for filing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review notice of appearance filed by Jeffrey A. Topor.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
7/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #17	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding case management on database.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Victoria Vasquez regarding case file on database.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding printed code made for case.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding electronic case file.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding electronic case file.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding electronic case file.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the proof of service of summons.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the proof of service of summons.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding proof of service of summons.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding proof of service of summons.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review executed summons and prepare for filing with court	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Review signed POS for service.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #18	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	File Proof of Service of Summons with court	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding the original proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding the original proof of service of summons.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding sending proof of service via mail and email.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding not receiving proof of service via email.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding SmartPay Leasing proof of service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding SmartPay Leasing proof of service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding receipt of proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding receipt of proof of service of summons.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding receipt of proof of service of summons.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/13/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding receipt of proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding approval to file proof of service of summons.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding approval to file proof of service of summons.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/13/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding approval to file proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/13/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding approval to file proof of service of summons.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/28/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration and all supporting documents.	\$ 785.00	2.1	\$ 1,648.50
7/28/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Download and save docket #20	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/28/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Download and save docket #19	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Proposed Order granting defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Proposed Order granting defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/29/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Proposed Order granting defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring defendant's motion to compel.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring defendant's motion to compel.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's motion to compel arbitration, including specific clauses cited by Defendant and how that many impact classwide issues, research caselaw cited in Defendant's motion, draft memo re: opposition to motion	\$ 525.00	4.5	\$ 2,362.50

7/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding deadline to oppose defendant's Motion to Compel.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding deadline to oppose defendant's Motion to Compel.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding deadline to oppose defendant's Motion to Compel.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/1/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's intent to file an answer to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's intent to file an answer to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/1/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's intent to file an answer to complaint.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/1/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeffrey Topor regarding defendant's motion to compel arbitration and intent to file an answer to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/2/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review joint stipulation to continue case management conference and impact on case management	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
8/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and analyze defendant's arbitration motion Research arbitration issue	\$ 575.00	2.6	\$ 1,495.00
8/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of opposition to motion for arbitration.	\$ 575.00	3.8	\$ 2,185.00
8/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft stipulation to continue CMC.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00



8/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeffrey Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's intent to file an answer.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Adam Belsey from Alexis Wood regarding research for defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding defendant's conflict with the CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's conflict with the CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/3/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's conflict with the CMC date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defendant's conflict with the CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/3/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defendant's conflict with the CMC date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/4/2017	Alexis Wood	Continue drafting opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
8/4/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #21	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/4/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed joint stipulation with proposed order to continue case management conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and edit opposition to arbitration motion.	\$ 575.00	2.9	\$ 1,667.50
8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding consent to continue CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding filing a stipulation requesting the CMC date be continued.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Proposed Order granting stipulation to continue CMC date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Adam Belsey regarding draft of opposition to defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Adam Belsey from Alexis Wood regarding feedback on draft of opposition to defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and edit opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
8/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and edit opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
8/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 785.00	1.3	\$ 1,020.50
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling a rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling a rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Adam Belsey regarding draft opposition to motion to compel revised with attorney's edits.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Adam Belsey from Alexis Wood regarding draft of opposition to motion to compel arbitration revised with attorney's edits.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Adam Belsey regarding arguments for plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Adam Belsey from Alexis Wood regarding arguments for plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeffrey Topor regarding scheduling the rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeffrey Topor regarding scheduling the rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Adam Belsey regarding final draft of opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing a draft of the initial disclosures.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing a draft of the initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to file either ADR Selection or Notice of Need for ADR Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to file either ADR Selection or Notice of Need for ADR Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to file either ADR Selection or Notice of Need for ADR Conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft of initial disclosures for review.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding draft of initial disclosures for review.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeffrey Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding available dates to conduct 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeffrey Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding available dates to conduct 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/10/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review order continuing case management conference.	\$ 785.00	0.6	\$ 471.00
8/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar continued CMC per doc no 22	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft Plaintiff's initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
8/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #22	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft joint 26f report.	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
8/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Edit oppitions to motion to compel arbitration and final comments to AW	\$ 525.00	2.8	\$ 1,470.00
8/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #23	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding drafting initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding drafting initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding preparing initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeffrey Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding stipulation to continue CMC date granted.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeffrey Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding stipulation to continue CMC date granted.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Order on Stipulation to continue CMC.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Order on Stipulation to continue CMC.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding new date and time for CMC.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration ready to file.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/11/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration ready to file.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding courtesy copies of plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay courtesy copies.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding reviewing courtesy copies of plaintiff's opposition to motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay courtesy copies.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #24	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/18/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Reply ISO Mtn to Compel Arbitration.	\$ 785.00	0.9	\$ 706.50
8/24/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review defendants ADR certification of discussion of ADR option and internal disussion of mediators	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
8/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #25	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/24/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding possibly using the Court's Mediation Program.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's Reply in support of its motion to compel arbiration, including preparing minor notes for oral agrument	\$ 525.00	1.3	\$ 682.50
8/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Defendant's Reply in support of its motion to compel arbiration	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00

8/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the continued CMC date and related deadlines.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the continued CMC date and related deadlines.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding the continued CMC date and related deadlines.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding the continued CMC date and related deadlines.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding continued deadlines related to new CMC hearing date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding continued deadlines related to new CMC hearing date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding continuing deadline related to new date for CMC.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding continuing deadline related to new date for CMC.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding availability for Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding availability for Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/27/2017	Kas Gallucci	Telephone call with Liana re ADR	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling the Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling the Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring date of Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring date of Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring date of Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring date of Rule 26(f) conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft joint case management statement.	\$ 575.00	1.8	\$ 1,035.00
8/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and edit joint case management statement based on defendant's edits.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
8/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding draft joint 26(f) report attached.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding draft joint 26(f) report attached.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Attend meet and confer regarding 26f report.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
8/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's redline to edits to draft joint 26(f) report.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's redline to edits to draft joint 26(f) report.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



8/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding accepting defendant's redline edits to draft joint 26(f) report.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding accepting defendant's redline edits to draft joint 26(f) report.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding notice of need for ADR phone conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding notice of need for ADR phone conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding final joint 26(f) report and related documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding final joint 26(f) report and related documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Defendant's initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
9/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/5/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding draft initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #27	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #26	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/6/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review ADR Phone Conference Scheduling Notice.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
9/6/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review ADR clerk's notice setting ADR phone conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Finalize notice of ADR conference.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00

9/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadline to serve initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadline to serve initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding initial disclosures ready to serve.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding initial disclosures ready to serve.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #28	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	calendar date of ADR conference per doc no 28.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review clerk's notice of ADR phone conference being rescheduled to 9/20/17.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's availability for ADR phone conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's availability for ADR phone conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's availability for ADR phone conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff counsel's availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff counsel's availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff counsel's availability for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding available date for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding available date for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Claudia Forehand from Jeff Topor regarding available date for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding resetting ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding resetting ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
9/7/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Claudia Forehand regarding resetting ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring new date for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring new date for ADR Phone Conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
9/7/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding calendar being updated with new ADR Phone Conference date.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
9/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding calendar being updated with new ADR Phone Conference date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/12/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding updating calendar with new ADR Phone Conference date.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
9/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding updating calendar with new ADR Phone Conference date.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
9/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Review joint case management statement.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$	345.00
9/19/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Case Management Statement.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$	392.50

9/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's minor addition to joint cm statement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's minor addition to joint cm statement.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding accepting defense counsel's minor addition to joint cm statement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding accepting defense counsel's minor addition to joint cm statement.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding further edits from defendant to joint cm statement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding further edits from defendant to joint cm statement.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding attached revise joint cm statement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding attached revise joint cm statement.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding revised joint cm statement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Review and edit Plaintiff's initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
9/21/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Joint Case Management Statement.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

9/21/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review clerk's notice that the ADR phone conference went forward on 9/20/17.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #29	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Alexis attending the hearing on defendant's motion to compel arbitration in person.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Alexis attending the hearing on defendant's motion to compel arbitration in person.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding date to serve initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/22/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding date to serve initial disclosures.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding date to serve initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding final draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/22/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding final draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding final draft of initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding serving initial disclosures by mail.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/22/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding serving initial disclosures by mail.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding serving initial disclosures by mail.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding looking up chambers/local rules for courtesy copies.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding looking up chambers/local rules for courtesy copies.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding no chambers rules on courtesy copies.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding no chambers rules on courtesy copies.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare binder for Motion to Compel Arbitration hearing	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
9/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding potential binder for hearing on motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding potential binder for hearing on motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding potential binder for hearing on motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

9/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Review all cases cited by parties associated with motion to compel arbitration in preparation for oral argument.	\$ 575.00	3.5	\$ 2,012.50
9/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Review all pleadings associated with motion to compel arbitration in preparation for oral argument.	\$ 575.00	2.6	\$ 1,495.00
9/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Review exhibits in preparation for oral argument.	\$ 575.00	1.6	\$ 920.00
9/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Travel from San Diego to San Francisco for hearing on Defendant's motion for arbitration	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
9/28/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review minute entry for hearing on defendants motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
9/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego re: arbitaiton motion	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
9/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review Minute Order and Calendar pretrial deadlines per Doc. No. 31.	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
9/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #31	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #30	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Prepare for CMC hearing and motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
9/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Court appearance for Case Management Conference and hearing regarding motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
9/29/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review notice that the case was assigned to a difference magistrate judge.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeffrey Topor from Ada Means regarding conference call to schedule the settlement conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Ada Means, Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding defense counsel's availability for conference call to schedule settlement conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding date given during the hearing on defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding date given during the hearing on defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding date given during the hearing on defendant's motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Ada Means from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff counsel's availability for conference call to schedule settlement conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for conference call with the Court on 10/4/17.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for conference call with the Court on 10/4/17.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ada Means regarding dial-in information for 10/4/17 conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ada Means regarding dial-in information for 10/4/17 conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding date for conference call being calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding conference call dial-in information.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring date of conference call to schedule settlement conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/30/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding case deadlines for discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding case deadlines for discovery.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/2/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #32	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/2/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review and calendar dates per Case Management Scheduling Order at Doc. No. 32	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
10/2/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Case Management Order re: Judge for Mediation / Settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.8	\$ 628.00
10/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft request for production of documents to defendant.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
10/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft interrogatories to defendant.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
10/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Edit requests for production of documents and interrogatories addressed to defendant in light of text messages	\$ 525.00	1.4	\$ 735.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Attend conference with settlement judge.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Review order regarding arbitration.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
10/3/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #33	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

10/3/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare cover letter and discovery for mailing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/3/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Order re: mtn to Compel Arbitration.	\$ 785.00	0.7	\$ 549.50
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Andrea Vasquez regarding draft proof of service of discovery for review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood from Andrea Vasquez regarding draft proof of service of discovery for review.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding draft stipulated protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding draft stipulated protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding updating calendar with conference call dial-in information.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding updating calendar with conference call dial-in information.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding serving interrogatories by mail.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding serving interrogatories by mail.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/3/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding prepared cover letter for corrected interrogatories.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding prepared cover letter for corrected interrogatories.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

10/4/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Court's Order denying arbitration and suggest obtaining transcript	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
10/4/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Notice & Order re: Settlement Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
10/4/2017	Allison Cardwell	Review order and calendar dates	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
10/4/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #34	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/4/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar date of settlement conference per doc. No. 34.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding interrogatories being mailed.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/5/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding interrogatories being mailed.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding interrogatories needing to be revised and served.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/5/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding interrogatories needing to be revised and served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/5/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding revised interrogatories being mail served.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/5/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding revised interrogatories being mail served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding follow up on draft stipulated protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/10/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding follow up on draft stipulated protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

10/10/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Victoria Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay initial disclosures.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/10/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Victoria Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay initial disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay initial disclosures attached.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/11/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay initial disclosures attached.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding draft protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding draft protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding draft protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding draft protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/17/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's initial disclosures possibly being late.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/17/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's initial disclosures possibly being late.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

10/18/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Stipulation to Extend Time.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
10/18/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Joint Stip to Extend Time.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
10/18/2017	Alexis Wood	Review joint motion to extend time to answer.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/18/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #35	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/18/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding date and type of service.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/18/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding date and type of service.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding no answer being filed.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding no answer being filed.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding requesting extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding requesting extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding granting defendant's request for extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding granting defendant's request for extension to respond to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

10/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding agreed upon extension for defendant to respond to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding agreed upon extension for defendant to respond to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding defense counsel's consent to e-sign stipulated protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding defense counsel's consent to e-sign stipulated protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Finalize protective order for filing.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
10/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #36	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar motion briefing schedule per doc no. 36.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/20/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Stipulation re: Protective Order.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
10/20/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Stipulated Protective Order.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Alexis Wood regarding proposed order granting joint stipulated protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to the Court from Alexis Wood regarding proposed order granting joint stipulated protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Create new case, calendar appeal deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50

10/24/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review notice of appeal filed in the federal circuit as to the order on motion to compel arbitration filed by Smartpay Leasing Inc.	\$ 785.00	2.4	\$ 1,884.00
10/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Research and calendar opposition deadline	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
10/24/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket # 37 and 38 and calendar	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
10/24/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review notice of appeal to the 9th circuit court of appeals filed by Smartpay Leasing Inc as to the order on motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
10/24/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Counsel Appearances and schedules in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Commence meet and confer over Defendant's deficient initial disclosures to request records be produced in light of the court entering a formal protective order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/25/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review protective order filed by Judge William Alsup granting the motion for protective order.	\$ 785.00	0.7	\$ 549.50
10/25/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review D's initial disclosures	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare, review, and circulate mediation questionnaire	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Research Notice of Appearances for the Ninth Circuit	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Research the filing of an appeal and effect on answer.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
10/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadline to oppose appeal.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadline to oppose appeal.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding deadlines in connection with appeal filing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding deadlines in connection with appeal filing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadlines in connection to the appeal.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding deadlines in connection to the appeal.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/25/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding appeal deadlines being calendared.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding appeal deadlines being calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defendant's providing full copy of the insurance plan since the Court entered the protective order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defendant's providing full copy of the insurance plan since the Court entered the protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's deadline to file an answer to the complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's deadline to file an answer to the complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding mediation questionnaire.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding mediation questionnaire.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding mediation questionnaire.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding filing out the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding filing out the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding filing out the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding getting notices of appearance on file.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding getting notices of appearance on file.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding getting notices of appearance on file.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Kas and Alexis not needing to file notices of appearance.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Kas and Alexis not needing to file notices of appearance.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Kas and Alexis not needing to file notices of appearance.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding attached draft mediation questionnaire.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/26/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding attached draft mediation questionnaire.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/26/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding attached draft mediation questionnaire.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding defendant reviewing the case plaintiff cited in support of their position on whether defendant needs to respond to complaint or not.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/27/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding defendant reviewing the case plaintiff cited in support of their position on whether defendant needs to respond to complaint or not.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/27/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff planning to continue with discovery despite defendant not yet responding to complaint.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/27/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff planning to continue with discovery despite defendant not yet responding to complaint.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/30/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Shawn Esparza Mediation Questionnaire in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
10/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	File Mediation Questionnaire	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/31/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Defendant's Mediation Questionnaire, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
10/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save Defendant's NOA, Mediation Questionnaire	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding following up on defendant producing their full insurance policy.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding following up on defendant producing their full insurance policy.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding reviewing and approving the mediation questionnaire to be filed.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding reviewing and approving the mediation questionnaire to be filed.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding reviewing and approving the mediation questionnaire to be filed.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

10/31/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding paralegal confirming they will file the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/31/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding paralegal confirming they will file the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/31/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding paralegal confirming they will file the mediation questionnaire.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/1/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #40 and calendar	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/1/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Answer to Complaint, including affirmative defenses and memo to attorneys re: next steps	\$ 785.00	2.1	\$ 1,648.50
11/1/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding defendant preparing their insurance policy in order to produce.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/1/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding defendant preparing their insurance policy in order to produce.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/2/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save NOA	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/2/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #5	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's Answer and how any defense may impact discovery and class certification	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$ 367.50

11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding the case deadlines and defendant's request for an extension to respond to discovery requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding extension plaintiff granted to respond to discovery requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding to plaintiff agreeing to defendant's extra day to the extension to respond only if they serve responses electronically.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff requesting the insurance policy be produced electronically.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff requesting the insurance policy be produced electronically.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/2/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defense counsel being out of the office.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/2/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defense counsel being out of the office.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review insurance policy	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
11/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Research CNG - check in go	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/6/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Smartpay Insurance Policy	\$ 785.00	2.5	\$ 1,962.50
11/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Review insurance policy.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
11/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Research CNG insured in Smartpay.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00

11/6/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Attorney meeting with KG and AW regarding SmartPay insurance, ability to pay and corporate formation and formalities	\$ 785.00	1.1	\$ 863.50
11/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Attorney meeting with AW and RAM regarding SmartPay insurance, ability to pay and corporate formation and formalities	\$ 525.00	1.1	\$ 577.50
11/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Attorney meeting with RAM and KG regarding SmartPay insurance, ability to pay and corporate formation and formalities	\$ 575.00	1.1	\$ 632.50
11/6/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding reading and analyzing the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding reading and analyzing the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/6/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding reading and analyzing the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/6/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell from Andrea Vasquez regarding Ron's analysis of the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/6/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Andrea Vasquez regarding Ron's analysis of the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding CNG being listed as the insured on the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

11/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding CNG being listed as the insured on the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/7/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding CNG being listed as the insured on the Smartpay insurance policy.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding CNG being listed as the insured on Smartpay insurance policy may contradict other information they've provided.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding CNG being listed as the insured on Smartpay insurance policy may contradict other information they've provided.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/7/2017	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding CNG being listed as the insured on Smartpay insurance policy may contradict other information they've provided.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/7/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Lilach Halperin from Alexis Wood regarding attached exemplar to help draft our opposition to the arbitration motion.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/13/2017	Alexis Wood	Review responses to discovery.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
11/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #41	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Reviewed and analyzed motion to stay district court proceeding.	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
11/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar Motion to Stay Briefing Schedule per Doc. No. 41	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download, calendar, Circulate ECF 41	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50



11/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's Motion to Stay and Supporting Documents.	\$ 785.00	1.1	\$ 863.50
11/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Victoria Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding dates to be calendared in connection with the appeal filing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding defendant's deadline to respond to discovery requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding discovery responses having been served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding the attached word version of the proposed order granting defendant's motion for stay of district case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the deadlines triggered by defendant's motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding the deadlines triggered by defendant's motion to stay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/15/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's deadline to oppose defendant's motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/15/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's deadline to oppose defendant's motion to stay.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/15/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's deadline to oppose defendant's motion to stay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

11/15/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding plaintiff's deadline to file their opposition to motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/15/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding plaintiff's deadline to file their opposition to motion to stay.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/15/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding plaintiff's deadline to file their opposition to motion to stay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/15/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding defendant filing their motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/15/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding defendant filing their motion to stay.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/15/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding defendant filing their motion to stay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
11/17/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexander Bush from Kas Gallucci regarding receiving defendant's responses to all requests.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/17/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexander Bush from Kas Gallucci regarding receiving defendant's responses to all requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar transcript designation date per Doc. No. 42.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #42	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #43	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #6	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

11/27/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Mediation Conference Notice, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
11/27/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar date of Mediation	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/28/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #44	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/28/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice of Rescheduled Mediation, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
11/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Review Defendant's motion to stay, includig all case law cited	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
11/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Draft opposition to motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	4.7	\$ 2,702.50
11/28/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit our Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay.	\$ 785.00	2.6	\$ 2,041.00
11/28/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/28/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
11/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Appeal Court from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for the confernce call scheduled.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Appeal Court from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for the confernce call scheduled.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
11/29/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare courtesy copies for dkt 44	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
11/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
11/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding courtesy copies being prepared for our opposition to the motion to stay.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

11/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding courtesy copies being prepared for our opposition to the motion to stay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/5/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Reply Memo ISO Mtn for Stay of District Court.	\$ 785.00	1.4	\$ 1,099.00
12/5/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #45	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/5/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's responses to Plaintiff's discovery in preparation for meet and confer letter	\$ 525.00	3.3	\$ 1,732.50
12/5/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring the dial-in information for the conference call with the Appeal Court.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/6/2017	Kas Gallucci	Draft meet and confer	\$ 525.00	2.6	\$ 1,365.00
12/7/2017	Kas Gallucci	Finalize and send meet and confer to Defendant's counsel regarding deficient discovery responses - 11 pages	\$ 525.00	1.7	\$ 892.50
12/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Draft subpoena to Twilio.	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$ 367.50
12/8/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's formal meet and confer letter and request for a conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's formal meet and confer letter and request for a conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's formal meet and confer letter and request for a conference call.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

12/8/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's formal meet and confer letter and request for a conference call.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding subpoenas to be sent out for service.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding subpoenas to be sent out for service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding Subpoena to be served 12/11/17.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/9/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding Subpoena to be served 12/11/17.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding Subpoena to be served 12/11/17.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding subpoena being sent for service and notice ready to be served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding subpoena being sent for service and notice ready to be served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/9/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to get the notice of subpoena out for service via mail.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/9/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to get the notice of subpoena out for service via mail.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/11/2017	Alexis Wood	Conference call with appeals court.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
12/12/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding availability for the conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/12/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding availability for the conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/12/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci, Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding availability for the conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding availability for the conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding service of the subpoena being completed.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/12/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirmation of the exact date the subpoena was served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding confirmation of the exact date the subpoena was served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Morris Phillips Process Server regarding the exact date the subpoena was served.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/12/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding the subpoena service date being confirmed by process server.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/12/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Morris Phillips Process Server from Allison Cardwell regarding the subpoena service date being confirmed by process server.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/12/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeffrey Lendrum regarding Peck decision for review that could be helpful.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/13/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Shaylla Hunter regarding subpoena and asking if there is a protective order in place.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #8	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Calendar amended briefing schedule deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Filed Order re: Mediation, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
12/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for a conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for a conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for a conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding unavailability for a conference call to discuss the formal letter meet and confer.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding a possible date for a call to discuss meet and confer for the following week.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding a possible date for a call to discuss meet and confer for the following week.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding a possible date for a call to discuss meet and confer for the following week.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding a possible date for a call to discuss meet and confer for the following week.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding being available late in the day that was proposed for a conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



12/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding being available late in the day that was proposed for a conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding being available late in the day that was proposed for a conference call.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding being available late in the day that was proposed for a conference call.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/14/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding confirming the date and time for a call to discuss the meet and confer.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding confirming the date and time for a call to discuss the meet and confer.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/14/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding confirming the date and time for a call to discuss the meet and confer.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding confirming the date and time for a call to discuss the meet and confer.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/14/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding conference call to discuss plaintiff's meet and confer being calendared.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/14/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding conference call to discuss plaintiff's meet and confer being calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/15/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding invitation to join the conference call scheduled.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/15/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Appeal Court regarding invitation to join the conference call scheduled.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/16/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring the conference call scheduled by the Appeal Court.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/16/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding confirmation of calendaring the conference call scheduled by the Appeal Court.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/18/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding following up on colleague's email confirming receipt of the subpoena and asking about protective order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/18/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Matthew Gainer from Kas Gallucci regarding the attached protective order in place.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding need for courtcall appearance for the motion to stay hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding need for courtcall appearance for the motion to stay hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/19/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding need for courtcall appearance for the motion to stay hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/19/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plan to appear in person to the motion to stay hearing and binder needed.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/19/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plan to appear in person to the motion to stay hearing and binder needed.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/19/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding plan to appear in person to the motion to stay hearing and binder needed.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing.	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
12/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Status conference with AW.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Flight from San Diego to San Fran re hearing on motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	4.2	\$ 2,415.00
12/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Kas' binder for hearing on Motion to Stay	\$ 215.00	1.5	\$ 322.50
12/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Status conference with KLG.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

12/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Status conference with AMW.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding needing to reschedule the conference call to discuss the meet and confer.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defense counsel needing to reschedule the call to discuss the meet and confer letter.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding defense counsel needing to reschedule the call to discuss the meet and confer letter.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/20/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding the binder for the motion to stay hearing being prepared.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/20/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding the binder for the motion to stay hearing being prepared.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/20/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding the binder for the motion to stay hearing being prepared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/21/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review minute entry for the motion hearing held on 12/21/17 for the motion to stay district court proceedings pending appeal.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Travel to hearing from hotel.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Return flight from hearing in san francisco - san Fran to San Diego.	\$ 575.00	3.7	\$ 2,127.50
12/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #46	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Meet and confer regarding Ds responses to Ps first set of discovery.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00

12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Meet and confer re D's responses to discovery.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Court appearance for motion to stay.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding possibly just bumping the call earlier or later in the same day instead of cancelling.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the binder and not needing the motion to compel arbitration briefing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the binder and not needing the motion to compel arbitration briefing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding the binder and not needing the motion to compel arbitration briefing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding binder and anything else needed for the hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding binder and anything else needed for the hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding binder and anything else needed for the hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding an available time the following day for the call to discuss plaintiff's meet and confer letter.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding defense's co-counsel being available for call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding plaintiff's counsel confirming availability for call the following day.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding defense co-counsel confirming availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the conference call being rescheduled to the following day.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/21/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the conference call being rescheduled to the following day.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding the conference call being rescheduled to the following day.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding Twilio's objections and responses to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Twilio's objections and responses attached.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Twilio's objections and responses attached.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/22/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Twilio's objections and responses attached.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/22/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Twilio's objections and responses attached.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/28/2017	Kas Gallucci	Review Twilio's response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$ 367.50
12/28/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding court information and login credentials for the case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding whether or not his clients will be supplementing their requests.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding whether or not his clients will be supplementing their requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Matthew Gainer from Kas Gallucci regarding availability for a call to discuss responses to requests for production.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Matthew Gainer from Kas Gallucci regarding availability for a call to discuss responses to requests for production.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding confirmation that defendant has not entered into any other agreements with Twilio aside from Twilio's TOS and AUP policies during the relevant time period.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

12/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding confirmation that defendant has not entered into any other agreements with Twilio aside from Twilio's TOS and AUP policies during the relevant time period.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Matthew Gainer from Kas Gallucci regarding availability for a conference call to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Matthew Gainer from Kas Gallucci regarding availability for a conference call to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/29/2017	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding sending a calendar invite for the meet and confer to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/29/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding sending a calendar invite for the meet and confer to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #47	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/30/2017	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Order Denying Motion for Stay.	\$ 785.00	0.9	\$ 706.50
12/30/2017	Kas Gallucci	Email to Matthew Gainer, Sheila Jambekar, Shaylla Hunter, Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendar invite for meet and confer to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



12/30/2017	Allison Cardwell	Email to Matthew Gainer, Sheila Jambekar, Shaylla Hunter, Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendar invite for meet and confer to discuss Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare amended rule 26(f) initial disclosures, including bates stamped documents.	\$ 525.00	1.1	\$ 577.50
1/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Sheila Jambekar regarding confirmation of availability for meet and confer on Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for meet and confer with Twilio re; subpoena	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
1/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Attend meet and confer with counsel for Twilio to discuss documents produced	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
1/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew Gainer regarding confirmation of availability for meet and confer on Twilio response to subpoena.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding following up on whether defendant will be supplementing the requests counsel indicated their client would need to look into.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding following up on whether defendant will be supplementing the requests counsel indicated their client would need to look into.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

1/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding defendant has on their radar to look into possibly supplementing requests.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding defendant has on their radar to look into possibly supplementing requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay news video on youtube.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay news video on youtube.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding emailing copy of the attached letter that was mailed as a courtesy.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/10/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding emailing copy of the attached letter that was mailed as a courtesy.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #48	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Review and calendar transcript deadlines per doc no. 48	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Review all thrid party discovery and determine follow up discovery and potential subpoenas.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
1/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding setting up a call before the follow up mediation conference.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

1/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding setting up a call before the follow up mediation conference.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding request for extension of time to serve their supplemental responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding request for extension of time to serve their supplemental responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/23/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice of Schedule Mediation Conference, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
1/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information for 2/16/18 Mediation conference call in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/24/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information for 2/16/18 Mediation conference call in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
1/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Appeal Court regarding conference call dial-in information for 2/16/18 Mediation conference call in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

1/29/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/29/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/29/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring information for Mediation conference call on 2/16/18 in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/30/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the Mediation conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

1/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the Mediation conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the Mediation conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/30/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding confirming the conference call for 2/16/18 was calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of second two of request for documents and interrogatories	\$ 575.00	1.5	\$ 862.50
2/1/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar conference call.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/1/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice of Rescheduled Mediation Conference, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
2/1/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 10.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

2/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft correspondence re meet and confer re: deficient discovery responses	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
2/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to serve resposes to discovery propounded on plaintiff.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding deadline to serve resposes to discovery propounded on plaintiff.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding having a different date calendared for plaintiff to serve discovery responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding having a different date calendared for plaintiff to serve discovery responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Appeal Court regarding conference call date being modified.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Appeal Court regarding conference call date being modified.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Appeal Court regarding conference call date being modified.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding updating calendar with the new 2/23/18 date for the Mediation conference call in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

2/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding updating calendar with the new 2/23/18 date for the Mediation conference call in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding the Notice of date change for the Mediation conference call and requesting the calendar be updated.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding the Notice of date change for the Mediation conference call and requesting the calendar be updated.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding the conference call with the appeal court and confirming calendar was updated.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding the Mediation conference call with the appeal court and confirming calendar was updated.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding the conference call with the appeal court and confirming calendar was updated.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding the conference call with the appeal court and confirming calendar was updated.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding adding the dial-in information to the calendar entry for the Mediation conference call in the appeal court.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding adding the dial-in information to the calendar entry for the Mediation conference call in the appeal court.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding adding the dial-in information to the calendar entry for the Mediation conference call in the appeal court.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/3/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to the appeal court from Jeff Topor regarding attached letter explaining why defense counsel is unavailable for the date the court noticed for the conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/3/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to the appeal court from Jeff Topor regarding attached letter explaining why defense counsel is unavailable for the date the court noticed for the conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/3/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to the appeal court from Jeff Topor regarding attached letter explaining why defense counsel is unavailable for the date the court noticed for the conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/6/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar new date of conference call for 2/26/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/6/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 11.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/6/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar service of RPDs set 2.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50



2/6/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice of Rescheduled Mediation Conference.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
2/6/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare RPDs set 2 for service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/6/2018	Heather Mora	Drive to USPS collections box and back to mail RPDs set 2.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, appeal court from Alexis Wood regarding preference of 2/26 for new conference date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding wanting to know what date defendant will produce supplemental documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding wanting to know what date defendant will produce supplemental documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from appeal court regarding dial-in information for upcoming conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from appeal court regarding dial-in information for upcoming conference call.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding conference call calendar entry being updated with new date.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding dial-in information to be added to calendar entry for conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding the new dial-in information for conference call.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding new dial-in information being added to the calendar entry.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding new dial-in information being added to the calendar entry.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding new dial-in information being added to the calendar entry.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding another follow up for supplemental documents from defendant.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding another follow up for supplemental documents from defendant.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding discovery to be served via mail.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding discovery to be served via mail.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding discovery to be served via mail.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding plaintiff counsel's reminder for defendant to produce supplemental documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding plaintiff counsel's reminder for defendant to produce supplemental documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding how long plaintiff has been waiting for defendant's supplemental document production.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding how long plaintiff has been waiting for defendant's supplemental document production.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Discovery Formatting	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding suggestion of a minor edit to the firm block.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding suggestion of a minor edit to the firm block.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding question about formatting of the request for production set 2.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding question about formatting of the request for production set 2.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding question about formatting of the request for production set 2.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding question about formatting of the request for production set 2.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding service date being calendared and requests ready to mail out.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding service date being calendared and requests ready to mail out.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding service date being calendared and requests ready to mail out.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding service date being calendared and requests ready to mail out.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding attached meet and confer and plaintiff's request for a call to discuss.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding attached meet and confer and plaintiffs request for a call to discuss.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding plan to discuss with client at the end of the week and then to give availability for a call with plaintiff counsel.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding plan to discuss with client at the end of the week and then to give availability for a call with plaintiff counsel.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

2/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff wanting to schedule a call for early following week.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff wanting to schedule a call for early following week.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
2/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Defendants unavailability to appear for scheduled Conference call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Defendants unavailability to appear for scheduled Conference call.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
2/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Review discovery served on Plaintiff Esparza in preparation to draft objections and responses	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$	805.00
2/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence drafting objections and responses to request for admissions.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$	1,207.50
2/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence drafting objections and responses to interrogatories	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$	2,070.00
2/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Review standing order of district judge t assure resposnes to discovery are in proper order	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft correspondence to client regarding discovery.	\$ 575.00	1.3	\$	747.50
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Review client documents for potential production.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$	402.50
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence drafting objections and responses to request for production	\$ 575.00	2.8	\$	1,610.00
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff's counsel still requesting a call to discuss status of defendant's supplemental document production.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

2/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding plaintiff's counsel still requesting a call to discuss status of defendant's supplemental document production.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding status of defendant's supplemental responses and providing responses to the two meet and confer letters.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding status of defendant's supplemental responses and providing responses to the two meet and confer letters.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding whether or not defendant plans to produce any additional documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding whether or not defendant plans to produce any additional documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding possibly scheduling a call for tomorrow.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding possibly scheduling a call for tomorrow.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/14/2018	Heather Mora	Revise calendar entry re client call.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/14/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar T/C for AMW and client.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/14/2018	Heather Mora	Calendared call for Alexis with client.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

2/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding available time frame for call tomorrow.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding available time frame for call tomorrow.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding attached discovery responses for client's review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding receipt of draft discovery responses and availability for a call to discuss.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with plaintiff regarding discovery responses.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize drafting objections and responses to request for admissions.	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize drafting objections and responses to interrogatories	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize drafting objections and responses to request for production	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Review new documents from plaintiff re; discovery	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding scheduled time to call client and discuss draft discovery responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding scheduled call with client to be calendared.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding scheduled call with client to be calendared.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding set time for call to discuss defendant's supplemental responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding set time for call to discuss defendant's supplemental responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding having to bump the call with client by 30 mins.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding defendant's supplemental responses already served.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding defendant's supplemental responses already served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding receipt of screenshots and attached verification for client to sign.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Copy of the label for the returned phone which was sent to smartpay per their request	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Copy of the label for the returned phone which was sent to smartpay per their request	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/20/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare discovery for service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Review amended discovery responses provided by Defendant	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
2/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft meet and confer correspondence regarding amended discovery.	\$ 575.00	2.6	\$ 1,495.00



2/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding New Verification for Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Smartpay texts to Shawn Esparza	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding New Verification for Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Attached Final Discovery Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions For Discovery Responses to be Served	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/21/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions For Plaintiff's Discovery Responses to be Served	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
2/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Judge Rules on Deposition Objections.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Judge Rules on Deposition Objections.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
2/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Discovery Responses Ready for Service.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
2/21/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Discovery Responses Ready for Service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
2/21/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Discovery Responses Ready for Service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00

2/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Follow up on why Defendant's Amended Responses were not served.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Judge Rules on Deposition Objections.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Judge Rules on Deposition Objections.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/23/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare 3rd set of RPDs to D for service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Defendant's Reply Deadline for Plaintiff's Discovery Responses.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Defendant's Reply Deadline for Plaintiff's Discovery Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Defendant's Reply Deadline for Plaintiff's Discovery Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Defendant's Reply Deadline for Plaintiff's Discovery Responses.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Prepare for call with appeals mediator.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
2/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Attend call with appeals mediator.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/27/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Mediation Order, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50

2/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Follow up on Defendants Amended Responses to Plaintiff's Request for Production 10, 11 & 24.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Follow up on Defendants Amended Responses to Plaintiff's Request for Production 10, 11 & 24.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/28/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar M&C for Kas and Alexis.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with counsel for defendant regarding plaintiff's correspondence regarding deficient discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
3/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Calendar Call with Defendants.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Calendar Call with Defendants.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Calendar Call with Defendants.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduled Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduled Call to Discuss Conflict of Dates on Plaintiff's Proposed Case Management Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding confirming calendared date for Meet & Confer call with Defendants to discuss proposed Case Mangement Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding confirming calendared date for Meet & Confer call with Defendants to discuss proposed Case Mangement Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding confirming calendared date for Meet & Confer call with Defendants to discuss proposed Case Mangement Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding confirming calendared date for Meet & Confer call with Defendants to discuss proposed Case Mangement Schedule for Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar New Deadlines on "Mediation Order Filed" in 9th Circuit Appeals Court.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar New Deadlines on "Mediation Order Filed" in 9th Circuit Appeals Court.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

3/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring New Deadlines on "Mediation Order Filed", in the 9th Circuit Appeals Court.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring New Deadlines on "Mediation Order Filed", in the 9th Circuit Appeals Court.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring New Deadlines on "Mediation Order Filed", in the 9th Circuit Appeals Court.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood Attached Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood Attached Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft joint motion to continue deadlines.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Edit Joint Mtn to Continue Remaining dates in Case Management Order.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
3/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize joint motion to continue deadlines.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/8/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 49.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
3/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Comments to Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Comments to Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Draft of Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates in the Case Management Order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Review meet and confer correspondence from defendant.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
3/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with plaintiff re; discovery responses	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Review documents re: discovery requests produced by Plaintiff	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
3/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Correspondence of Today's date discussing Defendant's attempt to meet & confer to discuss plaintiff's discovery responses to defendant's First Set of Discovery Requests.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Correspondence of Today's date discussing Defendant's attempt to meet & confer to discuss plaintiff's discovery responses to defendant's First Set of Discovery Requests.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Review Ds amended responses to request for production set one.	\$ 575.00	1.1	\$ 632.50
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Review Ds amended responses to request for production set two.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Defendant's Correspondence dated 3-13-18.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Defendant's Correspondence dated 3-13-18.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Requesting date for Defendant's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Requesting date for Defendant's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Interrogatories to Shawn Esparza on other Legal Case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduled Call to Discuss Defendant's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Scheduled Call to Discuss Defendant's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduled Call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduled Call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar scheduled call with Defendant's to discuss Defendants service of their Amended Responses to Plaintiff's Second set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar scheduled call with Defendant's to discuss Defendants service of their Amended Responses to Plaintiff's Second set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Confirmation of Calendared Scheduled Cal.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Instructions to Calendar Scheduled Call	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review Ds amended responses to interrogatories.	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$ 1,207.50

3/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review and analyze Ds additional document production.	\$ 525.00	4.1	\$ 2,152.50
3/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Research re sender of the text messages.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
3/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Defendant's Request for Interrogatory on Shawn Esparza's other legal case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Request for Interrogatory on Shawn Esparza's other legal case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Request for Interrogatory on Shawn Esparza's other legal case.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Interrogatories to Shawn Esparza on other Legal Case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Defendant's Request for Interrogatory on Shawn Esparza's other legal case.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Review request for responses regarding joint motion to continue.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/16/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Request for Response re: Joint Mtn to Continue.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Comments to Defendants Document Production and Amended Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Comments to Defendants Document Production and Amended Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Comments to Defendants Document Production and Amended Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Defendant's Interrogatories.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/17/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Scheduled Time to Discuss Defendant's Interrogatories.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft notice required by court regarding schedule and plaintiff's discovery status.	\$ 575.00	2.8	\$ 1,610.00
3/19/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Edit P's Response to the Court Re: Joint Mtn to Continue.	\$ 785.00	0.8	\$ 628.00
3/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Attached Supplemental Responses for Client Review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Attached Supplemental Responses for Client Review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Attached Supplemental Responses for Client Review.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare supplemental responses to ROGs for service.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

3/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize supplemental responses to ROGS	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
3/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions for Service on Plaintiff's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions for Service on Plaintiff's Supplemental Responses.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Proof of Service for Final Supplemental Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Proof of Service for Final Supplemental Responses.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review order granting in part joint motion to continue dates.	\$ 525.00	0.1	\$ 52.50
3/26/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 52.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
3/26/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order Granting in Part Joint Motion to Continue dates in Case Management Order.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
3/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Request for Extension to Finalize Responses to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Request for Extension to Finalize Responses to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Request for Extension to Respond to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Requests for Production of Documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Defendant's Request for Extension to Respond to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Requests for Production of Documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Request for Extension, and estimated time for completion of Defendant's Discovery Responses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Request for Extension, and estimated time for completion of Defendant's Discovery Responses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Allowance for Defendant's Request for Extension and date of deadline given to Defendant's.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Allowance for Defendant's Request for Extension and date of deadline given to Defendant's.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

3/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Clarification on Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Clarification on Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to verify Deadlines for Appeals, Discovery Cut off dates, Pretrial Conference dates.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay deadline correct date verification	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Review Ds response to RFPs Set 3.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
4/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review Ds response to RFPs Set 3.	\$ 525.00	1.9	\$ 997.50
4/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	commence review of all document produced by Defendants to date, 2,000 documents	\$ 525.00	4.3	\$ 2,257.50
4/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	continue to review of all document produced by Defendants to date, 2,000 documents	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
4/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft correspondence to defense counsel re depositions.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
4/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft 30b6 deposition topic and review other potential deponents.	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
4/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference call with Jeff Toper re case in general and depositions.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
4/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Attached Defendant's Responses to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Attached Defendant's Responses to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/6/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Attached Defendant's Responses to Plaintiff's 3rd Set of Request for Production of Documents.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Setting specific time for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Setting specific time for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/10/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Setting specific time for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



4/10/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Setting specific time for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Ltr to Judge re: Discovery Dispute + Exhibits.	\$ 785.00	2.7	\$ 2,119.50
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft letter discovery motion request for documents on the willful prong	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
4/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Provide case law citations supporting willful prong argument to be included in submission to Court	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
4/11/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar meet and confer for AMW.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Rescheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Rescheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Rescheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Rescheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Rescheduling Final time scheduled for Meet and Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar Meet & Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions to Calendar Meet & Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendared Meet & Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendared Meet & Confer on Defendant's Response to Plaintiff's Request for Production No. 27.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference call with defense counsel regarding meet and confer on discovery requests.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
4/13/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Order Setting Discovery Hearing re: Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
4/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions for Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions for Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instructions for Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Check Chambers Rules for specifics on Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Check Chambers Rules for specifics on Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Check Chambers Rules for specifics on Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to Check Chambers Rules for specifics on Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Chambers Rules on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Chambers Rules on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Chambers Rules on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

4/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Local Rule on Courtesy Copies for Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Finalized Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief for Attorney Review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Finalized Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief for Attorney Review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Finalized Courtesy Copies on Discovery Letter Brief for Attorney Review	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Follow up on Scheduling Deposition Dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Follow up on Scheduling Deposition Dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/14/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Follow up on Scheduling Deposition Dates.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Questions on Binder Preparation for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Questions on Binder Preparation for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Questions on Binder Preparation for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Plaintiff's Discovery Dispute.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
4/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for discovery hearing with AMW.	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$	1,207.50
4/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Prepare for discovery hearing with KG.	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$	1,207.50
4/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Diego to SF for discovery hearing on willfulness prong/class list	\$ 525.00	4.3	\$	2,257.50
4/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Review response to discovery letter from defendant.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$	402.50
4/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for discovery hearing.	\$ 525.00	3.9	\$	2,047.50
4/16/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 55.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
4/16/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Letter fm Defendant re: P's Discovery Letter Brief.	\$ 785.00	0.7	\$	549.50
4/17/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Picked up KLG from the airport.	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$	86.00
4/17/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Court Minute Entry re: Discovery Hearing.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$	78.50
4/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Court appearance for discovery dispute.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$	262.50
4/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Fran to San Diego re: discovery hearing	\$ 525.00	4.3	\$	2,257.50
4/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Meet and confer prior to court appearance with defendant's counsel	\$ 525.00	2	\$	1,050.00
4/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Draft order re discovery hearing	\$ 525.00	1.3	\$	682.50
4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice to Winnie Lai.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$	172.50
4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice to Paul Cathey.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$	172.50
4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice to Nick Whitson.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$	172.50
4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice to Jonathan Li.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$	172.50
4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice to 30b6.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$	460.00

4/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Deposition Dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Deposition Dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Deposition Dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/18/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Request for Deposition Dates.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/19/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Transcript Order.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Telephone call with Aiken Welch re SF depositions.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 58.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Telephone call with Ayotte & Shackelford re confirmation of deposition in or near Joshua Tree.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Review proposed order re: discovery hearing	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 57.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/19/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Proposed Order re: 56 Discovery Hearing.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Telephone call to Discovery Litigation Services re Joshua Tree deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Look for court reporters for depositions in May and June.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare and file order form for transcript of discovery hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Telephone call with Ayotte & Shackelford re pricing for a deposition in or near Joshua Tree.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50



4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Status on Plaintiff's Request for Deposition Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Proposed dates and locations.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Proposed dates and locations.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Proposed dates and locations.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Deposition Location / Logistics	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Deposition Location / Logistics	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Deposition Location / Logistics	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00

4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering Deposition Transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Request for name of 30b6 Deponent	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Request for name of 30b6 Deponent	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Ordering Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Ordering Deposition Transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Question on 3 day or 7 day Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Question on 3 day or 7 day Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Question on 3 day or 7 day Deposition Transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Prices for ordering 3 day or 7 day Deposition Transcript.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Prices for ordering 3 day or 7 day Deposition Transcript.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering 3 Day Deposition Transcript.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering 3 Day Deposition Transcript.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Ordering 3 Day Deposition Transcript.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Attached Deposition Order Form.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Attached Deposition Order Form.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Alsup from Kas Gallucci regarding Attached Proposed Order Discovery Hearing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Alsup from Kas Gallucci regarding Attached Proposed Order Discovery Hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Alsup from Kas Gallucci regarding Attached Proposed Order Discovery Hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Alsup from Kas Gallucci regarding Attached Proposed Order Discovery Hearing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Judge Alsup from Kas Gallucci regarding Attached Proposed Order Discovery Hearing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Judge Alsup's Request Proposed Order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Judge Alsup's Request Proposed Order.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Request for Proposed Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Request for Proposed Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Request for Proposed Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to File Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to File Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to File Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Using RAM or KG's ECF account in order to file the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Using RAM or KG's ECF account in order to file the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to use KG's ECF account to file Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to use KG's ECF account to file Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Instructions to use KG's ECF account to file Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's request for Plaintiff to Withdraw filed Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's request for Plaintiff to Withdraw filed Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kathy Wyatt from Heather Mora regarding transcript order form Dkt 58.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kathy Wyatt from Heather Mora regarding transcript order form Dkt 59.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kathy Wyatt from Heather Mora regarding transcript order form Dkt 60.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding Invoice for Kathy Wyatt.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/19/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Heather Mora regarding Invoice for Kathy Wyatt.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 59.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Scanned / Saved / Printed in preparation for filing and case management receipts from Kas' trip re discovery hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar deadline for Defendant to respond to RPD no. 27.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

4/20/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order re: Discovery Dispute.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kathy Wyatt from Heather Mora regarding Check attached For GSO Invoice.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kathy Wyatt from Heather Mora regarding Check attached For GSO Invoice.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to pscsr@aol.com from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding reviewing edits to Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing, before turning in to chambers.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding asking if Defenant's have edits to the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing, before turning in to chambers.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding asking if Defenant's have edits to the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing, before turning in to chambers.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's indication of not having reviewed the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's indication of not having reviewed the Proposed Order on Discovery Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding attached rates and services.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding docket 57.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding docket 58.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding docket 59.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "Alexis Wood (SBN 270200)" from Heather Mora regarding Fwd: SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Alexis Wood (SBN 270200)" from Heather Mora regarding Fwd: SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instruction to serve SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instruction to serve SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Instruction to serve SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding updating the location in the SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding updating the location in the SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding updating the location in the SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition Notices.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from "Ayotte & Shackelford, Inc." <PSCSR@aol.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling for 05/07/2018 Esparza vs. Smart Pay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from "Ayotte & Shackelford, Inc." <PSCSR@aol.com> regarding Web Based Video Conferencing Confirmation of Scheduling for 05/07/2018 Esparza vs. Smart Pay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to customerservice2@aikenwelch.com from Heather Mora regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to customerservice2@aikenwelch.com from Heather Mora regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "Heather Mora" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Heather Mora" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "Heather Mora" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Heather Mora" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition date confirmations.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition date confirmations.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition date confirmations.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from "Ayotte & Shackelford, Inc." <PSCSR@aol.com> regarding Updated/Web Based Video Conferencing Confirmation of Scheduling for 06/15/2018 Esparza vs. Smart Pay.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition of Paul Cathey.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition of Paul Cathey.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding re-sent Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition of Paul Cathey.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding re-sent Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition of Paul Cathey.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding third time sending Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition of Paul Cathey.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from "Ayotte & Shackelford, Inc." <PSCSR@aol.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling for 06/15/2018 Esparza vs. Smartpay Leasing, Inc.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from "Ayotte & Shackelford, Inc." <PSCSR@aol.com> regarding Web based video conferencing Confirmation of Scheduling for 06/15/2018 Esparza vs. Smartpay Leasing, Inc.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/20/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Ayotte Shackelford Shared <ASDepos@litigationsservices.com> from Heather Mora regarding SmartPay / Joshua Tree Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/22/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Transcript for hearing held on 4-17-18.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
4/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kathy Wyatt regarding receipt of refund for invoice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kathy Wyatt regarding receipt of refund for invoice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kathy Wyatt regarding receipt of refund for invoice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "'Heather Mora'" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding confirm that the PMK of Smartpay is at 9:00 am.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Heather Mora" from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding confirm that the PMK of Smartpay is at 9:00 am.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "Alexis Wood (SBN 270200)" from Heather Mora regarding SF Court reporter	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Alexis Wood (SBN 270200)" from Heather Mora regarding SF Court reporter	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc. / Deposition Notices	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding PMK depo schedule change	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding PMK depo schedule change	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding smartpay depo schedule change	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling 06/12/2018 93769 (UPDATED START TIME)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling 05/30/2018 93766	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling 06/07/2018 93768	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/24/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling 06/19/2018 93770	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's request to schedule Plaintiff's Deposition on June 8th.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
4/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- Plaintiff's requesting names of the 30(b)(6) witnesses.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
4/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- Plaintiff's requesting names of the 30(b)(6) witnesses.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00

4/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding the details of last weeks Discovey Hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding the details of last weeks Discovey Hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/27/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/27/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- deposition availability	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Mtn for Leave and supporting Documents.	\$ 785.00	1.7	\$ 1,334.50
4/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and analysis motion for leave to file motion for reconsideration and motion to compel, including research of caselaw	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
4/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft opposition to motion for leave to file motion for reconsideration and motion to compel.	\$ 575.00	4.7	\$ 2,702.50
5/1/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar all 5 depositions.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/1/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare amended notices for service.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/1/2018	Heather Mora	Call court reporter to change depo of Whitson and Lai.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft amended deposition notices.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00



5/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mr. Whitson's deposition from June 7th to June 6th.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mr. Whitson's deposition from June 7th to June 6th.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
5/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Aiken Welch from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Aiken Welch from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Scheduling Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Aiken Welch from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Scheduling Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft Plaintiff's Notice of Defendant's Non-Compliance w/Court Order & Opposition to Defendant's Motion for Reconsideration Regarding Order on Discovery Dispute.	\$ 575.00	1.6	\$	920.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

5/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding amended notices - Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Crystal Proffitt regarding Reschedule Confirmation of Whitson & Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding date of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding date of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding date of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Deposition of Shawn Esparza	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Scheduling Deposition of Shawn Esparza	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's availability for Deposition and 30(b)(6)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's availability for Deposition and 30(b)(6)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/3/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize notice of non compliance	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50

5/3/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Reply to P's Ntc of D's Non-Compliance w/Court Order.	\$ 785.00	0.6	\$ 471.00
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 62.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 63.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Prepare courtesy copies.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Notice (Other)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Notice (Other)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucc regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/4/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies - Doc. No. 62	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
5/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and analyze reply motion for leave to file motion for reconsideration.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$	460.00
5/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review and analyze reply motion for leave to file motion for reconsideration.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
5/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review and analyze reply motion for leave to file motion for reconsideration.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$	345.00
5/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling of 30(b)(6) Depostion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling of 30(b)(6) Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Date and Location of Plaintiff's Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Date and Location of Plaintiff's Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Date and Location of Plaintiff's Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/10/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 64.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
5/10/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Order Denying Motion for Leave to File Motion for Reconsideration.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
5/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Date and Location of Plaintiff's Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

5/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding time of Plaintiff's Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Conference with AMW regarding defendant's request for stipulation regarding TCPA.	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
5/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and set up arrangements for notice of deposition to client.	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
5/11/2018	Heather Mora	Phone call to client - left message.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with KLG regarding defendant's request for a stipulation regarding TCPA.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
5/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Order Denying Motion for Reconsideration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Order Denying Motion for Reconsideration	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Confrence	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Confrence	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Confrence	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Confrence	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Notice of Plaintiff's Deposition - Confirming Date and Time	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Notice of Plaintiff's Deposition - Confirming Date and Time	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Flight Information for Settlement Conference.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Flight Information for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hotel Stay for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Travel Arrangements for Settlement Csonfrenc	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Service of Plaintiff's Deposition Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding --Service of Plaintiff's Deposition Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notices - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notices - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Proposed Stipulation to Willfullness	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Proposed Stipulation to Willfulness	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Proposed Stipulation to Willfulness	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Proposed Stipulation of Willfulness	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order of 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order of 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Notice of Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Second Motion for Reconsideration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Second Motion for Reconsideration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Stipulation for Reconsideration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Stipulation for Reconsideration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Phone call to client - left message.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/14/2018	Alexis Attisha	Scanned / Saved / Printed in preparation for filing and case management notice of deposition of plaintiff.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Phone call with client re flight.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar depo of client.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- depositions of SmartPay and Winnie Lai	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- depositions of SmartPay and Winnie Lai	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- depositions of SmartPay and Winnie Lai	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- depositions of SmartPay and Winnie Lai	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend Settlement Confrence	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attendher Depostion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Arrangements for Plaintiff to Attend her Depostion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar AMW flight for 6/18/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar KLG & AMW flight on 6/11/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar client flight on 6/18/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar KLG flight for 6/6/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar AMW flight for 6/7/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar KLG flight for 5/30/18.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Phone call with client re flight.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci re: Travel Confirmations for Depositions	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza com from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Travel Confirmation--Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza com from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Travel Confirmation--Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Cancelled Travel Arrangements	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/15/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Cancelled Travel Arrangements	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Rearranging Plaintiff's Travel Plans for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/16/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Rearranging Plaintiff's Travel Plans for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

5/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Flight and Hotel Information for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/16/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Flight and Hotel Information for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Changing Plaintiff's Travel Arrangements for Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/16/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Changing Plaintiff's Travel Arrangements for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/17/2018	Alexis Wood	Review notice by Smartpay on discovery order.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/17/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's Notice of Compliance with the Court's Order.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Flight and Hotel Confirmation - Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/17/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Flight and Hotel Confirmation - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Shawn Esparza regarding Question about Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/17/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Shawn Esparza regarding Question about Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

5/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza , Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza, Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/17/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza, Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Plaintiff's Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/17/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora reregarding Plaintiff's Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice - Discovery Letter Brief (Doc. No. 65)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice - Discovery Letter Brief (Doc. No. 65)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan , Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice - Discovery Letter Brief (Doc. No. 65)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Shawn Esparza <rpesme@yahoo.com> regarding Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Response to Question about Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Shawn Esparza from Heather Mora regarding Response to Question about Hotel Information - Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Alexis Attisha Regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Heather Mora from Alexis Attisha Regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Response to Discovery Letter Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/21/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket text re order approving request for extension.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50



5/21/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket text re request for extension.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/21/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Defendant's Request for Extension of Time to File Opening Brief, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
5/21/2018	Alexis Attisha	Normalizing phone numbers on excel spread sheet.	\$ 215.00	3.6	\$ 774.00
5/22/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar optional reply brief.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/22/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar new date for appellee answer brief deadline.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/22/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar new date for appellant opening brief deadline.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Attisha from Kas Gallucci regarding Oranzing Smartpay Text Message Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Attisha regarding Oranzing Smartpay Text Message Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/23/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar deadline to accept Ds offer of judgment.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/23/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	5	\$ 1,075.00
5/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Unusable Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Document Conversion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Document Conversion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Response to Question about Document Conversion of Defendant's Response to RFP #27	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding egarding Response to Question about Document Conversion of Defendant's Response to RFP #27	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Failure to Produce Response to Request for Production #27	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "'Liana Mayilyan'" from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Failure to Produce Response to Request for Production #27	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/25/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	6	\$ 1,290.00

5/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Stop Message Hisztory Produced by Defendant	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Hansen" from Kas Gallucci regarding Stop Message Hisztory Produced by Defendant	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/26/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	14	\$	3,010.00
5/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Attisha egarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <eff@tcpawitness.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Response to Request for Production #27 - Document Conversion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/27/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	12	\$	2,580.00
5/28/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	11	\$	2,365.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review discovery documents for deposition of Jonathan Li.	\$ 525.00	3.2	\$	1,680.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for deposition of Jonathan Li, draft outline and prepare exhibits	\$ 525.00	5.2	\$	2,730.00

5/29/2018	Alexis Attisha	Editing phone numbers on excel spreadsheet. (Normalize phone numbers on excel spread sheet due to improper production by Defendant)	\$ 215.00	5	\$ 1,075.00
5/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Victoria Bellini regarding Deposition Cocnfirmation - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Updated Text Message History Excel Sheet-	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Response to Question about Text Message History Spreadsheet	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Response to RFP #27	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding regarding Defendant's Response to RFP #27	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unique Phone Numbers	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Additional Data Produced by Defendant	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Scheduling Call to Discuss Data with Expert	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/29/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Conference with AMW regarding deposition.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
5/30/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar conference call for AMW re rescheduling status conference.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Review rule 68 offer of judgment, including client communication	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
5/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft settlement brief for settlement conference.	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Diego to San Francisco for Jonathan Li deposition.	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
5/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with KLG regarding deposition.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Attend the deposition of Jonathan Li.	\$ 525.00	4.3	\$ 2,257.50
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego after the Jonathan Li deposition.	\$ 525.00	3.2	\$ 1,680.00

5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Document Conversion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Prodcution in Excel Format	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Attisha regarding Phone Number History Spreadsheet	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Missing Records	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Missing Records	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Time of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Time of 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Scheduling Deposition Prep	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with Plaintiff regarding settlement conference change of date and rule 68 offer.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Calendar / vacate settlement conference.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Download and save docket # 66.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/31/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Minute Entry re: Telephone Conference held on 5/31/18.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Cancel hotel rooms re settlement conference.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Cancel flights re settlement conference.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kwiks3@aol.com from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay's Text Message Short Codes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to awsf@aikenwelch.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Document for 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Rule 68	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to alexis@consumersadvocates.com, lmayilyan@snllp.com from Ada_Means@cand.uscourts.gov regarding Rescheduling Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Ada_Means@cand.uscourts.gov, lmayilyan@snllp.com from Alexis Wood regarding Rescheduling Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Rescheduling Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Rescheduling Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Circulating Smartpay Document Production	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Circulating Smartpay Document Production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Circulating Smartpay Document Production	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
5/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Circulating Smartpay Document Production	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. 17-3421	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kwikcsr3@aol.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Business Information	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00

5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Ada_Means@cand.uscourts.gov Ada_Means@cand.uscourts.gov from Liana Mayilyan regarding Rescheduling Settlnent Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Circulating Document Production	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Circulating Document Production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Circulating Document Production	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Circulating Document Production	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Ada_Means@cand.uscourts.gov regarding Settlement Conference Dial In Number	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Results of Defendant's Document Prozduction	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Reminder of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Reminder of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Reminder of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring of Rescheduled Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Engagement Letter	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - 30(b)(6)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Court Reporter for 30(b)(6)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Court Reporter for 30(b)(6)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/31/2018	Heather Mora	Email to "Kas Gallucci (SBN 288709)" , "Alexis Wood (SBN 270200)" from Heather Mora regarding Smartpay / SF depositions	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Smarpay Shortcodes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <kwikcsr3@aol.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Smarpay Shortcodes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Cancelling Travel Arrangements for Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Cancelling Travel Arrangements for Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Informing Client of Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Informing Client of Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Scheduling Deposition Prep	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Informing Client of Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Informing Client of Off Calendar Scheduling Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring deposition prep with client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/1/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Calendaring deposition prep with client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding Email Client Received from Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Shawn Esparza regarding regarding Email Client Received from Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Proof of Service - Plaintiff's Expert Witness Disclosures	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/2/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Proof of Service - Plaintiff's Expert Witness Disclosures	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding cancellation of travel arrangements for off calendar scheduling conference	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding cancellation of travel arrangements for off calendar scheduling conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding cancellation of travel arrangements for off calendar scheduling conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/2/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/2/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/3/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/3/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Prepare for deposition prep with client, create outline and review discovery responses by Plaintiff	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
6/4/2018	Alexis Attisha	Scanned / Saved / Printed in preparation for filing and case management objections to plaintiff's notice of deposition of defendant.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/4/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendared AW depo prep with client.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/4/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Confirmation of Deposition Prep	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "alexis@consumersadvocates.com" from Confirmation of Deposition Prep	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. SmartPay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Calendaring Time of Deposition Prep with Client	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Class Representative Duties	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Victoria Bellini regarding Deposition Confirmation - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - 30(b)(6) and Winnie Lai	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding CConfirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini <customerservice@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of 30(b)(6)	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/5/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Upcoming Discovery Production	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Upcoming Discovery Production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review Defendant's document production in preparation for deposition of Nick Whitson deposition	\$ 525.00	2.7	\$ 1,417.50
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for Nick Whitson deposition, draft outline and prepare exhibits	\$ 525.00	4.8	\$ 2,520.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel to San Francisco for Nick Whitson deposition.	\$ 525.00	3.5	\$ 1,837.50
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Attended the deposition of Nick Whitson.	\$ 525.00	2.5	\$ 1,312.50
6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence preparation for 30b6 deposition, including review of documents	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Continue preparation for 30b6 deposition, draft outline	\$ 575.00	4.7	\$ 2,702.50
6/6/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit depo outline for 30b6 witness	\$ 785.00	2.4	\$ 1,884.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego after Nick Whitson deposition.	\$ 525.00	3	\$ 1,575.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Print exhibits in preparation of Lai depo.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits to Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits to Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits to Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Circulating Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey to Court Reporter	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Service of Amended Deposition Notice of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Court Reporter from Heather Mora regarding Cancellation of Scheduling for Settlement Conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Victoria Bellini regarding Heather Mora Depostion Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Depostion Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Scheduling Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <kwikcsr3@aol.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Deposition Transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <kwikcsr3@aol.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Deposition Transcript Turn Around	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Deposition Transcript Turn Around	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Deposition Transcript Jonathan Li rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Rough Deposition Transcript - Jonathan LI	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding Rough Deposition Transcript - Jonathan LI	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Prepare for plaintiff deposition.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Travel to plaintiff's deposition in AZ from San Diego.	\$ 575.00	5.7	\$ 3,277.50
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Conference with plaintiff to prepare for deposition.	\$ 575.00	2.6	\$ 1,495.00
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding printing documents for 30(b)(6) deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding printing documents for 30(b)(6) deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 30(b)(6) Deposition Outline	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 30(b)(6) Deposition Outline	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding printing documents for 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding printing documents for 30(b)(6) Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Printing documents for 30(b)(6) Deposition - Completed	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/7/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Printing documents for 30(b)(6) Deposition - Completed	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Travel from Phoenix, AZ to plaintiff in Mesa, AZ.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
6/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Defend the deposition of Shawn Esparza.	\$ 575.00	4.3	\$ 2,472.50
6/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Travel from deposition of Plaintiff - from AZ to CA.	\$ 575.00	6.5	\$ 3,737.50
6/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Deposition Translation - Plaintiff's Depo	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Liana Mayilyan regarding Deposition Translation - Plaintiff's Depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Translation - Plaintiff's Depo	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Translation - Plaintiff's Depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Updated Production - Dial List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Updated Production - Dial List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Updated Production - Dial List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Updated Production - Dial List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unique Phone Numbers	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unique Phone Numbers	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/9/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansenrom Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel to San Francisco from San Diego for 30b6 deposition.	\$ 525.00	3.9	\$	2,047.50
6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Prepare for 30b6 deposition - review all documents and edit outline	\$ 525.00	2.7	\$	1,417.50
6/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Travel to San Francisco from San Diego for 30b6 deposition.	\$ 575.00	3.9	\$	2,242.50
6/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	\$ 575.00	4.3	\$	2,472.50
6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Rough draft of deposition of Nick Whitson	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Rough draft of deposition of Nick Whitson	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Victoria Bellini regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of Winnie Lai Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/11/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini from Heather Mora regarding Confirmation of Winne Lai Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Telephone call with Plaintiff's Expert regarding coding and ATDS issues	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$	367.50
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Attend 30(b)(6) deposition.	\$ 525.00	8.5	\$	4,462.50
6/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Attend 30b6 deposition.	\$ 575.00	8.5	\$	4,887.50
6/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego after 30b6 deposition.	\$ 575.00	4.8	\$	2,760.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego after 30b6 deposition.	\$ 525.00	4.8	\$	2,520.00
6/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Beginning Work on Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com>, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding g Beginning Work on Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Participation throughout the Deposition of Winnie Lai	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Participation throughout the Deposition of Winnie Lai	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding circulating Briefing of Motion to Compel - Related Case - Legal Research	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding circulating Briefing of Motion to Compel - Related Case - Legal Research	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding elated Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding related Smartpay Appellate Case - Legal Research	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration and Incorporated Memorandum	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration and Incorporated Memorandum	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration and Incorporated Memorandum	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Motion to Compel Arbitration and Incorporated Memorandum	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding appeal opening brief attached	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding appeal opening brief attached	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding information relating to consumers stored on SQL database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set 3	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Review additional text messages from client.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
6/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set One	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/13/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set One	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiffs' RFPs Set One	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/13/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/13/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Andrea Vasquez	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Andrea Vasquez regarding RFP's Served on defendants	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com>, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding expert deposition scheduled	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com>, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding expert deposition scheduled	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Bates stamping P's Responses to D's Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Bates stamping P's Responses to D's Discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Bates stamping P's discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding More texts? Not sure if you have??	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding attached P's doc production	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Depo location depo of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Depo location depo of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Depo location depo of Paul Cathey	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Depo location depo of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Depo location depo of Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of deposition schedule	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of deposition schedule	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of deposition schedule	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to from Customer Service <customerservice2@aikenwelch.com> regarding Confirmation of deposition schedule	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding status of Lai rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini <customerservice@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding confirmation request for depo of Paul Cathey 06/15/2018 95933	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Victoria Bellini <customerservice@aikenwelch.com> from Heather Mora regarding confirmation request for depo of Paul Cathey 06/15/2018 95934	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding status of Lai rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding status of Lai rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, "Jeff Hansen" <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Text Message History Excel Sheet- Unedited	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Lai Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Lai Rough draft	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Lai Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding update on status of Lai Rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to jeff@tcpawitness.com, alexis@consumersadvocates.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: Entire Lai rough draft	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to jeff@tcpawitness.com, alexis@consumersadvocates.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: Entire Lai rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kwikcsr3@aol.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Entire Lai rough draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding Rough draft of deposition of Paul Cathey - 6/15/2018	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to kas@consumersadvocates.com from kwikcsr3@aol.com regarding ROUGH DRAFT OF DEPOSITION OF PAUL CATHEY - 6/15/2018	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



6/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Rough draft of deposition of Paul Cathey - 6/15/2018	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, "Jeff Hansen" <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Rough draft of deposition of Paul Cathey - 6/15/2018	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Rough draft of deposition of Paul Cathey - 6/15/2018	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <kwikcsr3@aol.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding ROUGH DRAFT OF DEPOSITION OF PAUL CATHEY - 6/15/2018	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <kwikcsr3@aol.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding ROUGH DRAFT OF DEPOSITION OF PAUL CATHEY - 6/15/2019	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Southwest Airlines Passenger Itinerary	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Southwest Airlines Passenger Itinerary	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Review transcript of Jonathan Li.	\$ 575.00	2.2	\$ 1,265.00
6/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding meet and confer over Defendant's response to RFP No. 28	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding meet and confer over Defendant's response to RFP No. 29	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding meet and confer over Defendant's response to RFP No. 30	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding page 26:7 of cathey depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding page 26:7 of cathey depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding page 26:7 of cathey depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding page 26:7 of cathey depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and review all relevant websites that deal with the Twilio platform and create PDFs to provide to expert	\$ 215.00	8	\$ 1,720.00
6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Discuss with KLG regarding motion to extend time for discovery and additional documents needed.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Discuss with AMW regarding motion to extend time for discovery and additional documents needed.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Hansen" <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Paul Cathey And Winnie Lai Depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "'Jeff Hansen"' <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Paul Cathey And Winnie Lai Depo	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Requested depo transcript of Jonathan Li	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Requested depo transcript of Jonathan Li	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Requested depo transcript of Jonathan Li	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Requested depo transcript of Jonathan Li	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Requested depo transcript of Jonathan Li	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding d's response to (RFP .28)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding d's response to (RFP .28)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding d's response to (RFP .28)	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/20/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Review deposition transcript with Plaintiff	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$	402.50

6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding depo transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Page 26:7 of Depo transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Page 26:7 of Depo transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding extending discovery dates	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding extending discovery dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding extending discovery dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding twiliodocs	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding twiliodocs	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding twiliodocs	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding twiliodocs	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding twiliodocs	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci, Heather Mora , Andrea Vasquez from Allison Cardwell regarding PDF project on adobe for Mac	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #16	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/22/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Defendant's Opening Brief - appeal	\$ 785.00	1.9	\$ 1,491.50
6/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #15	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendared last day for Esparza depo transcrip to be held in court reporters office.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "alexis@consumersadvocates.com" from Diana Lacson <dlacson@uslegalsupport.com> regarding Attached code letter to witness	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "alexis@consumersadvocates.com" from Diana Lacson <dlacon@uslegalsupport.com> regarding Attached code letter to witness	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding Jonathan Li (Esparza) 05-30-18	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding Jonathan Li (Esparza) 05-30-18	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. SmartPay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza vs SmartPay Leasing, Inc.   Shawn Marie Esparza   6.8.2018	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza vs SmartPay Leasing, Inc.   Shawn Marie Esparza   6.8.2018	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza vs SmartPay Leasing, Inc.   Shawn Marie Esparza   6.8.2018	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza vs SmartPay Leasing, Inc.   Shawn Marie Esparza   6.8.2018	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza - hearing transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding case jurisdiction district	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding case jurisdiction district	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - hearing transcript subfolder location	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to "alexis@consumersadvocates.com" from Shawn Esparza regarding Esparza v. SmartPay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to rpesme@yahoo.com from Alexis Wood regarding conference call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <klgallucci@gmail.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to klgallucci@gmail.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to klgallucci@gmail.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/23/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to <klgallucci@gmail.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #67	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #17	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to ""Jeff Topor"" , ""Liana Mayilyan"" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Leasing, Inc. Motion to Continue	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #68	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/27/2018	Alexis Wood	Review order granting in part and denying in part motion to continue.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
6/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Update calendar with new deadlines per Doc. No. 68.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
6/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Review modified case management order per Doc. No. 68.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/27/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order Granting Joint Motion to Continue Remaining Dates.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
6/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review all relevant websites that deal with the Twilio platform which were created into PDF by Allison Cardwell for expert	\$ 525.00	5.2	\$ 2,730.00
6/27/2018	Alexis Wood	Review Twilio interactive website and document dealing with Twilio platom	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
6/28/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared Subsequent Case management conference, date of trial, pretrial conference, deadline to file dispositive motions, deadlines for expert witness disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/28/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Flight itinerary for July 19th hearing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/29/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and anayse deposition transcript of Nick Whitson.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
6/29/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #18	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/29/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #19	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding dates extended by Court Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding dates extended by Court Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding dates extended by Court Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding transcript request	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding attached transcript	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding attached transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding attached transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding attached transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding PTX file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding PTX file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/30/2018	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding status of documents responsive to RFP 28	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding PTX file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding status of documents responsive to RFP 28	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding status of documents responsive to RFP 29	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding status of documents responsive to RFP 30	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Paul Cathey 06-15-18 regular and confidential transcripts	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Paul Cathey 06-15-18 regular and confidential transcripts	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Paul Cathey 06-15-18 regular and confidential transcripts	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Jada <transcripts@aikenwelch.com> regarding Paul Cathey 06-15-18 regular and confidential transcripts	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



7/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Request for a phone call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to ""Jeff Topor"" , ""Liana Mayilyan"" from Kas Gallucci regarding batestamping the responsive material	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to ""Jeff Topor"" , ""Liana Mayilyan"" from Kas Gallucci regarding batestamping the responsive material	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and analyze opening 9th circuit brief	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
7/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and shepardize the case law in the opening breif	\$ 575.00	4.3	\$ 2,472.50
7/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence answer to appeal - review and analze issues presented by defendant	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
7/12/2018	Alexis Wood	continue drafting answer to appeal - statement of the case and statement of facts	\$ 575.00	4.1	\$ 2,357.50
7/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to ""Jeff Topor"" , ""Liana Mayilyan"" from Kas Gallucci regarding batestamping the responsive material	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding batestamping the responsive material	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Jeff Topor" , "Liana Mayilyan" from Kas Gallucci regarding batestamping the responsive material	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Requesting CD containing depo transcript	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Requesting CD containing depo transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Requesting CD containing depo transcript	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Requesting CD containing depo transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Requesting CD containing depo transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay - New Expert Dates	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay - New Expert Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/14/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/14/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
7/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/14/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding drop box link to bates stamped documents	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/16/2018	Alexis Wood	Meeting with KLG regarding status.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
7/16/2018	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with AMW regarding status.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$	262.50
7/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines for Motions in Limine and deadline to file Joint Proposed Pretrial Order.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/17/2018	Alexis Wood	continue to draft answer to appeal - argument re the fed policy favoring arbitration	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$	1,840.00
7/17/2018	Alexis Wood	continue to draft answer to appeal - the scope of Plaintiff's claims and law re: lease purchse agreements	\$ 575.00	4.6	\$	2,645.00

7/17/2018	Alexis Wood	Research caselaw regarding lease purchase agreement re: appeal	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Continue drafting answer to appeal - summary of all cases presented by Defendant	\$ 575.00	5.2	\$ 2,990.00
7/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared deadline date for packet of Interlineations of deposition designations.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Continue drafting answer to appeal - the agreement is not an umbrella agreement	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding pretrial deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding pretrial conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding pretrial conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding pretrial conference	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding New Expert Dates	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding calendaring based on calculated deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding calendaring based on calculated deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/18/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding prepare a proposed stipulation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding prepare a proposed stipulation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/18/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci, Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/19/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Answering Brief.	\$ 785.00	4.6	\$ 3,611.00
7/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review & Edit Answering Brief.	\$ 525.00	5.2	\$ 2,730.00
7/23/2018	Alexis Attisha	Scanned and saved signed errata sheets for depositions Jonathan Li and Paul Cathey.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Finalize answer to appeal.	\$ 575.00	5.6	\$ 3,220.00
7/23/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft joint stipulation regarding authentication.	\$ 575.00	1.3	\$ 747.50
7/24/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Authentication of Stop Message List	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/24/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding invoice for deposition	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/24/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding invoice for deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/24/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding invoice for deposition	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/24/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding invoice for deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Review edits to answer to appeal.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
7/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Review Broeck v. Raymours pleading regarding appeal.	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
7/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding invoice for deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/27/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding revision of draft of stipulation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Liana Mayilyan from Jeff Topor regarding revision of draft of stipulation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/28/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci , Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci , Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding updated timesheet	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding updated timesheet	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding to do list	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/2/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendared discovery cutoff dates, expert witness disclosures.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/2/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/2/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/3/2018	Allison Cardwell	Review calendar and docket, prepare for upcoming deadlines.	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
8/3/2018	Allison Cardwell	Review docket and calendar, plan for upcoming deadlines	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
8/3/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



8/3/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding non expert discovery triggered deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/4/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/10/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci, Andrea Vasquez from Alexis Attisha <clerk@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Aiken Welch Invoice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/10/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci , Mike Houchin <mike@consumersadvocates.com>, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell , Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com> from Andrea Vasquez regarding Ltr from Rosana Klingerman	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/14/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci , Mike Houchin <mike@consumersadvocates.com>, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell , Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com> from Andrea Vasquez regarding Ltr from Rosana Klingerman	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

8/14/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron <ron@consumersadvocates.com>, Kas Gallucci , Mike Houchin <mike@consumersadvocates.com>, Heather Mora , Allison Cardwell , Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com> from Andrea Vasquez regarding Ltr from Rosana Klingerman	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #20	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendar extension per Doc. Nos. 21	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/17/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed final Answering Brief	\$ 785.00	0.8	\$ 628.00
8/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Submit streamline request for extension of time	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
8/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #21	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/17/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Streamlined request for extension of time to file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/17/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Streamlined request for extension of time to file	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/18/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/18/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay Appeal Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding updated joint case management statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Phone call with Jeff Topor regarding CMC statement.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50

8/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding updated joint case management statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding updated joint case management statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/28/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Flight itinerary for July 19th hearing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Flight itinerary for July 19th hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Flight itinerary for July 19th hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Kas Gallucci regarding	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Kas Gallucci regarding	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding July 13 defendant document production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding July 13 defendant document production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding July 13 defendant document production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/29/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding July 13 defendant document production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



8/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding joint case management statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding joint case management statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/30/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding please save to brenda in pleadings folder for Smartpay case	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/31/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding pleadings saved to database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/31/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Declaration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/3/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding declaration draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Draft notice of motion for class certification.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
9/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Draft plaintiff declaration in support of motion for class certification.	\$ 525.00	1.3	\$ 682.50
9/4/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding declaration draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

9/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel to San Francisco from San Diego for subsequent case management conference.	\$ 525.00	4.2	\$ 2,205.00
9/5/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding declaration draft	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/5/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> regarding declaration draft	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/6/2018	Kas Gallucci	Travel from San Fran to San Diego for subsequent case management conference.	\$ 525.00	3.9	\$ 2,047.50
9/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Minute Entry re: 9/6/18 Management Conference	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/7/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared Motions in Limine, deadlines for Joint Proposed Pretrial Order.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/7/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket 70, Calendar applicable deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
9/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com>, Ronald Marron , Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding September 18th, hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com>, Ronald Marron , Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding September 18th, hearing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Tania Babaie <tania@consumersadvocates.com>, Ronald Marron , Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding September 18th, hearing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



9/7/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Tania Babaie <vania@consumersadvocates.com>, Ronald Marron , Andrea Vasquez from Kas Gallucci regarding September 18th, hearing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to efiling@cand.uscourts.gov from ECF-CAND@cand.uscourts.gov regarding Case management conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/7/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to efiling@cand.uscourts.gov from ECF-CAND@cand.uscourts.gov regarding Case management conference	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/10/2018	Allison Cardwell	Update deadlines according to amended case management order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/10/2018	Allison Cardwell	Review amended Case Management Order at Doc. No. 71.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/10/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review First Amended Case Management Order.	\$ 785.00	1.6	\$ 1,256.00
9/10/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #71	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared for Dispositive Motions, expert discovery cutoff dates.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendar updated deadline per Doc. No. 72	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #72	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/11/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Amended Civil Minutes.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Last court day for moving party to continue motion hearing date	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/12/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Last court day for moving party to continue motion hearing date	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

9/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Reviewed and edited opposition to motion to compel arbitration - 9th circuit motion.	\$ 525.00	5.3	\$ 2,782.50
9/24/2018	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with LH regarding opposition to 9th circuit motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/24/2018	Lilach Halperin	Meeting with KLG regarding opposition to 9th circuit motion to compel arbitration.	\$ 440.00	0.2	\$ 88.00
9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #23	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #22	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Research and coordinate paper copy filing	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to alexis@consumersadvocates.com, kas@consumersadvocates.com from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding attached document from westlaw	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Lilach Halperin <lilach@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Latests version of brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Lilach Halperin <lilach@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Latests version of brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Lilach Halperin <lilach@consumersadvocates.com> regarding Sullivan v. All Web Leads, Inc. Edits	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding phone call with client	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com>, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Order of attached brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com>, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Order of attached brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com>, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Order of attached brief	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com> regarding initial review of documents	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to "allison@consumersadvocates.com" from Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com> regarding Attached estimate	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to "allison@consumersadvocates.com" from Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com> regarding Attached estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to "allison@consumersadvocates.com" from Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com> regarding Attached estimate	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

9/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to "allison@consumersadvocates.com" from Cockle Legal Briefs <contact@cocklelegalbriefs.com> regarding Invoice Attached	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #24	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay brief delivered	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/27/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay brief delivered	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
9/27/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Smartpay brief delivered	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/11/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Review Defendant's Request for Extension of time to file Reply Brief, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
10/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #26	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/11/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #25	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/25/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #27	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email from Alexis Wood , to Kas Gallucci regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email from Alexis Wood , to Kas Gallucci regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

10/25/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/25/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding Oral Argument Schedule	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
10/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #28	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
10/26/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Defendant's Correspondence re: Availability for Oral Argument, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
11/13/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #29	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/13/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #30	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/13/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Defendant's Reply Brief, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	1.7	\$ 1,334.50
11/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Reviewed Defendant's Reply Brief, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	2.2	\$ 1,727.00
11/20/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #31	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/29/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #32	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/29/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice for Upcoming Oral Argument Calendar, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
11/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #33	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
11/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Draft and file oral argument availability	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
11/30/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Defendant's Correspondence re: Availability for Oral Argument, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
12/6/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines for filing of Motion.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/6/2018	Alexis Wood	Commence drafting class certification motion - Factual Background Section/Review deposition transcript of 30b6	\$ 575.00	4.2	\$ 2,415.00

12/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification motion - background on Smartpay's practice	\$ 575.00	3.8	\$ 2,185.00
12/7/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification motion - facts regarding Ms. Esparza's claims	\$ 575.00	3.4	\$ 1,955.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification motion - numerosity argument	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification motion - commonality argument	\$ 575.00	2.8	\$ 1,610.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification - typicality argument	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci Expert Declaration - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Declaration - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/8/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/8/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Legal Research: Keim v. ADF MidAtlantic, LLC	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certification motion - Superiority argument	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
12/9/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft class certificaion motion - predominance argument	\$ 575.00	4.2	\$ 2,415.00
12/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and review class certification motion	\$ 575.00	4.3	\$ 2,472.50
12/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Draft supporting documents including declaration of Ronald A. Marron	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
12/10/2018	Alexis Wood	Review, add and higlight all Exhibits in support of class certification	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
12/10/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and edited P's Ntc of Mtn & Mtn for Class Cert./ my Declaration / Review Exhibits 1-14.	\$ 785.00	4.3	\$ 3,375.50
12/10/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review and edit class certifiation motion, including edits to fact section and additional of addiotnal exhibits	\$ 525.00	3.4	\$ 1,785.00
12/10/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review and edit argument section of class certificaion, including westlaw research for relevant inclusion of caselaw	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
12/11/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Shaawn Esparza m from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Declaration ISO Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/11/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shaaen Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Declaration ISO Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Phone call with Jeff Hansen and Alexis Wood regarding class certificaion motion	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00



12/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Phone call with Jeff Hansen and Kas Gallucci regarding class certificaion motion	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
12/12/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/12/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/13/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regardingExpert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/13/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regardingExpert Witness Declaration ISO Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/19/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review and edit motion for class certifiaton, including supporting documents and declaration of Jeff Hansen	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
12/19/2018	Alexis Wood	Review and edit declaration of Jeff Hansen	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
12/20/2018	Alexis Wood	Review, edit and finalize motion for class certificaion and supporting documents	\$ 575.00	4.7	\$ 2,702.50
12/20/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Final review and edit of Motion for Class Certification and supporting documents	\$ 785.00	1.4	\$ 1,099.00
12/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review proposed stipulation regarding briefing schedule.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
12/21/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Joint Stip re: Briefing & Hrg schedule regareding P's mtn for Class Cert.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #74	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendar MCC briefing schedule	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Print, hole punch, organize exhibits, assemble and mail courtesy copies of Plaintiff's MCC	\$ 215.00	2.3	\$ 494.50
12/21/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #73 - P's Motion for Class Certification and all attachments.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
12/21/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

12/21/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/21/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies-Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/22/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding ng Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Heather Mora regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza / Courtesy Copies - Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to alexis@consumersadvocates.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to alexis@consumersadvocates.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Plaintiff's Expert Designation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Plaintiff's Expert Designation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Plaintiff's Expert Designation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Activity in Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Jeff Topor regarding Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Stipulation to Amend Class Certification Schedule -- Proposed Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/22/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to the Court from Jeff Topor regarding Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Stipulation to Amend Class Certification Schedule -- Proposed Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/22/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Email to the Court from Jeff Topor regarding Case 3:17-cv-03421-WHA Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Stipulation to Amend Class Certification Schedule -- Proposed Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

12/26/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order Granting Joint Stipulation re: Briefing & Hearing Schedule on Motion for Class Certification.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
12/26/2018	Kas Gallucci	Review order granting in part briefing schedule.	\$ 525.00	0.1	\$ 52.50
12/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendar deadlines per Doc. No. 75	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
12/26/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #75	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/28/2018	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay Declaration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
12/28/2018	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Declaration ISO Rely - Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
12/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Calendar date of oral argumuent	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/30/2018	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Notice of Oral Argument, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
12/30/2018	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #34	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
12/30/2018	Heather Mora	Email to andrea@consumersadvocates.com from ca9_ecfnoticing@ca9.uscourts.gov regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "NOTICE -- Oral Argument Schedule"	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines for P's reply iso Mtn for Class Cert / and D's opposition deadline.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/9/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #76	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/9/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendar Motion to Stay Briefing Schedule per Doc. No. 76	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Ntc of Mtn to Stay Case Pending 9th Circuit.	\$ 785.00	0.9	\$ 706.50

1/10/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Consulted with an appellate specialist On Augmenting the record, Rule 10 of the Appellate procedure rules and RJN	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
1/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Consulted with an appellate specialist On Augmenting the record, Rule 10 of the Appellate procedure rules and RJN	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
1/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Review appellate filings to determine whether a motion to supplement the record re class cert should be filed in 9th Circuit	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
1/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. (Case No. 3:17-cv-03421-WHA) -- Proposed Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to the Court from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. (Case No. 3:17-cv-03421-WHA) -- Proposed Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



1/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding calendaring appellate deadlines according to 9th Circuit rules.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendar appellate deadlines according to 9th circuit rules	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Reviewed and analyzed defendant's motion to stay, including research caselaw provided in motion	\$ 575.00	1.7	\$ 977.50
1/17/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #77	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/17/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed D's Memo of P's and A's in Oppo to P's Mtn for Class Cert. / Jeff Topor's Declaration.	\$ 785.00	2.2	\$ 1,727.00
1/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Reviewed and analyzed D's Memo of P's and A's in Oppo to P's Mtn for Class Cert. / Jeff Topor's Declaration.	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
1/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Read, analyze and shepardize all case law presented in D's Oppo to P's Mtn for Class Cert	\$ 575.00	3.4	\$ 1,955.00
1/18/2019	Alexis Wod	Reivew and analyze Defendant's Motion to Stay	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
1/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendat's Opposition to Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

1/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Research oppoing caselaw to Ds oppo to MCC in preparation for drafting response	\$ 575.00	2.7	\$ 1,552.50
1/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of reply in support of MCC - response regarding class definition	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
1/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Continue to draft reply in support of MCC response regarding numerosity and predominance	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
1/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Continue to draft reply in support of MCC response regarding consent issue	\$ 575.00	4.2	\$ 2,415.00
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Commence draft of oppoistion to motion to stay - factual and procedural background	\$ 525.00	3.2	\$ 1,680.00
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Commence draft of oppoistion to motion to stay - Research all case law in Ds motion	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
1/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit opposition to motion to stay - factual and procedural background	\$ 575.00	1.5	\$ 862.50
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring error	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Larson v. Harman Management Corporation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Larson v. Harman Management Corporation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Research cases regarding ability to revise class.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
1/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Continue drafting oppoition to motion to stay - argument first amendment	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$ 1,207.50
1/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Continue drafting oppoition to motion to stay - writ of certiorair in Marks	\$ 525.00	3.4	\$ 1,785.00
1/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Continue drafting oppoition to motion to stay - irreparable harm and injury to class	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
1/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Read & Edit P's Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay.	\$ 785.00	3.2	\$ 2,512.00
1/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Read & Edit P's Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay.	\$ 785.00	2.5	\$ 1,962.50
1/23/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared dates for hearing on Motion to Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Meeting with AW re: Plaintiff's Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
1/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Meeting with RAM re: Plaintiff's Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
1/24/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #78	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/24/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Courtesy Copies of Plaintiff's Opposition to Motion for Stay, Mail	\$ 215.00	0.6	\$ 129.00
1/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Research cases regarding numerosity.	\$ 575.00	3.5	\$ 2,012.50

1/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding filing final draft of Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding filing final draft of Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding filing final draft of Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding smartPayfiling final draft of Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/24/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding courtesy copies of the Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Reivew, revise and edit reply in support of MCC.	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
1/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Reivew, revise and edit reply in support of MCC.	\$ 525.00	3.6	\$ 1,890.00
1/25/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Case Management Statement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza's deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

1/26/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza deposition transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza's attached deposition transcript	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza's attached deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Edit and add caselaw in support of reply to motion to class certification	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
1/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit declaration of Jeff Hansen in support of reply to class cert	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
1/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza's copy of deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza's copy of deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Esparza's copy of deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with expert and declaration from expert in support of MCC.	\$ 575.00	1.3	\$ 747.50
1/29/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding review of deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/29/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding review of deposition transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review Expert Report of Jeffrey Hansen for completeness and to ensure all opinions retained for have an opinion	\$ 525.00	2.9	\$ 1,522.50

1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Research regarding twilio.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$ 1,207.50
1/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit reply in support of MCC	\$ 785.00	3.2	\$ 2,512.00
1/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review D's Reply Memo ISO Mtn to Stay	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Review, edit and finalize reply re motion for class certification	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
1/30/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #79	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Rand Salvador regarding GSL Data Solutions	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to from Rand Salvador regarding GSL Data Solutions	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to from Rand Salvador regarding GSL Data Solutions	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding signing a supplemental declaration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding signing a supplemental declaration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert deposition transcript review	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to from Rand Salvador regarding GSL Data Solutions Setup	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
1/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza Supplemental Declaration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
1/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza Supplement Declaration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
1/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	Convert webpage to be used as exhibit 2 to Plaintiff's reply in Support of Class Cert.	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$	86.00
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Work with expert on finalizing declaration in support of reply MCC.	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$	1,207.50
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Meeting with RAM re: Plaintiff's Oppo to D's Mtn for Stay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
1/31/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Meeting with AW re: Plaintiff's Reply in support of Motion for Class Cert.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
1/31/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review, Edit Draft of P's Reply ISO Mtn for Class Cert./ review exhibits 1-4.	\$ 785.00	0.6	\$	471.00
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize reply in support of MCC.	\$ 575.00	6.4	\$	3,680.00
1/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	File Plaintiff's Reply in Support of Class Certification with the Southern District of California.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$	64.50
1/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Courtesy Copies of Plaintiff's Reply In Support of Motion for Class Certification	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$	64.50

1/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	Printed Plaintiff's Reply in Support of Motion for Class Certification for Courtesy Copies	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save Plaintiff's rely in Support of Class Certification - Docket No. 80-80.6	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
1/31/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Northrup v. Innovative Health Insurance Partners, LLC Regarding Attached files	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/31/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/31/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
1/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
1/31/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding export report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepared Courtesy copies of Plaintiff's Reply in Support of Class Cert for Mailing via GSO.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and work with expert on final expert report including all exhibits	\$ 575.00	5.3	\$ 3,047.50
2/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Upload documents re: Plaintiff's expert reports to dropbox	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
2/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Create dropbox folder for Plaintiff's expert disclosure, circulate link.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



2/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare exhibit tabs AD-AW in both word and PDF for Plaintiff's Expert Disclosure	\$ 215.00	0.6	\$ 129.00
2/1/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Jonathon Li deposition transcript	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Jonathon Li deposition transcript	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits to supplemental declaration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/1/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Edits to supplemental declaration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding expert report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding expert report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding expert report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, liana@snllp.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, liana@snllp.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, liana@snllp.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Jeff Topor, liana@snllp.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay - Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding preparing binders for hearings on Motion to Stay and Motion to Certify Class	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Print documents for both Kas & Alexis' binders for upcoming hearing on Motion for stay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing on MCC, including drafting outline and review of all cases	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Organize and hole punch document's for Alexis' binder on Motion for Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Organize and hole punch documents for Kas' binder on Motion for Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50

2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Kas' binder for upcoming hearing on Motion to Stay case.	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Draft cover page for both Kas and Alexis Motion for Class Certification binders.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Draft binder cover page for both Kas and Alexis' binders for hearing on Motion to Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Draft table of contents for both Kas and Alexis' binders for hearing on Motion to Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Assemble Alexis' binder for upcoming Hearing on Motion for Class Certification.	\$ 215.00	0.8	\$ 172.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Assemble Kas' binder for upcoming Motion for Class Certification Hearing.	\$ 215.00	0.8	\$ 172.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prtepare binder dividers and exhibit tabs for Alexis' binder on the Motion for Class Certification.	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare binder dividers and exhibit tabs for Kas' Motion for Class Certification Binder	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Alexis' binder for upcoming hearing on Motion for Stay.	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Draft table of contents for both Kas and Alexis Motion for Class Certification binders.	\$ 215.00	0.4	\$ 86.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Print & Organize Motion for Class Certification, Opposition, Reply and All Exhibits for Kas' Binder.	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Print & Organize Motion for Class Certification, Opposition, Reply and All Exhibits for Alexis' Binder.	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50

2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Hole punch all document's for Kas' Motion for Class Certification Binder.	\$ 215.00	0.6	\$ 129.00
2/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Hole punch all documents for Alexis' Motion for Class Certification Binder.	\$ 215.00	0.6	\$ 129.00
2/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Prep for hearing on motion to stay	\$ 525.00	1.6	\$ 840.00
2/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Listen to circuit court oral argument on similar issue re: motion to stay	\$ 525.00	1.5	\$ 787.50
2/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Travel to SF. From San Diego for MCC & Stay hearing, including fight & taxi.	\$ 525.00	7.6	\$ 3,990.00
2/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel to SF. From San Diego for MCC & Stay hearing, including fight & taxi.	\$ 575.00	7.6	\$ 4,370.00
2/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Prep for hearing on motion to stay	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$ 1,207.50

2/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing on motion for class certificaion	\$ 575.00	2.5	\$ 1,437.50
2/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding available deposition dates.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Travel to Court for MCC & Stay hearing.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
2/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel to Court for MCC & Stay hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
2/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Court appearance for Hearing on MCC & Stay, on record	\$ 525.00	1.6	\$ 840.00
2/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review Order re: Mtn for Class Cert / Minute Order.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00

2/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Travel to San Diego from SF re MCC & Stay hearing, including fight & taxi.	\$ 525.00	8.3	\$ 4,357.50
2/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel to San Diego from SF re MCC & Stay hearing, including fight & taxi.	\$ 575.00	8.3	\$ 4,772.50
2/14/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #82	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding Deposition Date Availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding Deposition Date Availability	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Liana Mayilyan from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Regarding Deposition Date Availability	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/15/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadline to file joint status report.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Telephone call with Jeff Hansen re: MCC hearing	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$ 210.00
2/17/2019	Aleixs Wood	Research case law in preparation to draft motion for summary judgment on ATDS issue	\$ 525.00	2.6	\$ 1,365.00
2/17/2019	Aleixs Wood	Commence draft of summary judgment motion on ATDS issue re: factual and procedural background	\$ 525.00	4.2	\$ 2,205.00
2/18/2019	Aleixs Wood	Continue draft of summary judgment motion on ATDS issue re: legal argument on Smartpay's system	\$ 525.00	3.7	\$ 1,942.50
2/18/2019	Aleixs Wood	Review and analyze 30b6 deposition and deposition transcript of other witness to support summary judgment	\$ 525.00	4.2	\$ 2,205.00
2/19/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit draft of summary judgment motion on ATDS issue	\$ 785.00	4.3	\$ 3,375.50
2/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit draft of summary judgment motion on ATDS issue	\$ 525.00	3.4	\$ 1,785.00

2/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #83	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Create appellate case calendar	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed USCA Order.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
2/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Court's Order re: Oral Argument,in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #35	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Binders for for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Excerpts of Record binders for Oral Argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding fo Excerpts of Record binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

2/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding for smartpay Excerpts of Record binders for Oral Argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding for smartpay Excerpts of Record binders for Oral Argument	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Telephone call to Jeff Topor - left voicemail to discuss appeal and potential joint filing.	\$ 525.00	0.1	\$ 52.50
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft joint status report.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Strategy meeting with Kas Gallucci and Ron Marron in light of ruling from appeal court that motion to compel arbitration will be decided on the papers.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Strategy meeting with Kas Gallucci and Alexis Wood n in light of ruling from appeal court that motion to compel arbitration will be decided on the papers.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Strategy meeting with Alexis Wood and Ron Marron in light of ruling from appeal court that motion to compel arbitration will be decided on the papers.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding appellate order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding order cancelling oral argument	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from IMS Customer Service regarding IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from IMS Customer Service regarding IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from IMS Customer Service regarding IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Fwd: IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Fwd: IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Fwd: IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Fwd: IMS Wireless Block Identifier update	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza Status Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Liana Mayilyan from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza Status Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza Status Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

2/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding regarding oral argument filing requirements	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Order filed by clerk cancelling oral argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Liana Mayilyan regarding Order filed by clerk cancelling oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Order at Docket 83	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Liana Mayilyan, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Order at Docket 83	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C with 9th Cir. Appellate Attorney on next steps.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
2/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Review correspondence from Jeff Toper and discuss with RAM and KLG regarding delay and settlement.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00

2/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review correspondence from Jeff Topor and discuss with RAM and AMW regarding delay and settlement.	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$ 210.00
2/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review correspondence from Jeff Topor and discuss with AMW and KLG regarding delay and settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
2/26/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendared KG's call with David from Heffler to discuss claims admin quote.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
2/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Discussion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Discussion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Discussion	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Conference with AMW and KLG regarding settlement and next steps.	\$ 785.00	0.8	\$ 628.00
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with RAM and KLG regarding settlement and next steps.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
2/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Conference with AMW and RAM regarding settlement and next steps.	\$ 525.00	0.8	\$ 420.00
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Call to defense counsel regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding Joint Motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Telephone conference with Alexis Wood re: settlement class members.	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$ 210.00
2/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Catherine Lirio regarding joint motion to request mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/28/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

2/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/28/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
2/28/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
2/28/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
2/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay's insurance policy	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Call with defense counsel regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
3/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/1/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding larger class settlement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

3/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding Plaintiff Contact Information	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding Plaintiff Contact Information	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and analyze estimate from Heffler for class notice.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
3/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Confernece with Kas Gallucci estimate from Heffler for class notice.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
3/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Confernece with Alexis Wood estimate from Heffler for class notice.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
3/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman <dkaufman@hefflerclaims.com> regarding Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/5/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding ND Cal Class Action Rules	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding ND Cal Class Action Rules	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/5/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding claim's administration estimate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Research caselaw in preparation to draft settlement demand	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$	1,380.00
3/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with all defense counsel regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of proposal for settlement demand.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$	690.00
3/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Work on settlement demand with KLG.	\$ 575.00	1.3	\$	747.50
3/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Work on settlement demand with AMW.	\$ 525.00	1.3	\$	682.50
3/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Review prior settlements in similarly structured TCPA cases.	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$	1,840.00
3/15/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #36	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
3/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Numbers For Two Different Classes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Numbers For Two Different Classes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Numbers For Two Different Classes	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/16/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from ca9_ecfnoticing@ca9.uscourts.gov regarding Submitted Briefs	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00



3/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding amount per class member in similar case	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/16/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding amount per class member in similar case	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding amount per class member in similar case	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/16/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding amount per class member in similar case	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize demand letter with settlement demand	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$	1,840.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Research re: Notice	\$ 525.00	0.8	\$	420.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Reviewed and edited settlement demand	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$	367.50
3/19/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and edited settlement demand	\$ 785.00	1.6	\$	1,256.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00

3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding creating an account on corporation wiki	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Research potential mediators and prior TCPA experience of mediators	\$ 575.00	1.5	\$ 862.50
3/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding attached settlement communication	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding attached settlement communication	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding attached settlement communication	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Jeff Topor Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Allison Cardwell regarding attached settlement communication	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
3/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding settlement proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding settlement proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding settlement proposal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

3/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator in California	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator in California	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, finding a mediator in California	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #84	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Edit Notice of Ruling	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Telephone conference with Thompson re: claims administration	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with AMW to discuss claim administration quotes	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Meeting with KLG to discuss claim administration quotes	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Memorandum Disposition, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #37	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Review memorandum disposition regarding ninth appeal.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Discuss memorandum disposition with AMW and KLG.	\$ 785.00	0.9	\$ 706.50

3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Discuss memorandum disposition with AMW and RAM.	\$ 525.00	0.9	\$ 472.50
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Discuss memorandum disposition with KLG and RAM.	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft Joint Notice of 9th Circuit Ruling.	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Gandhi as mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Gandhi as mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Gandhi as mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, choosing between Gandhi and Papas as mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, choosing between Gandhi and Papas as mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, choosing between Gandhi and Papas as mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Magistrate as mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Magistrate as mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Magistrate as mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement proposal, Judge Gonzales as possible mediator	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding service of disposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding service of disposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding joint filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding joint filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding joint filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding joint filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding review memorandum	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. review Memorandum Filed	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. review Memorandum Filed	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. review Memorandum Filed	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Memorandum Filed"	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to "Alexis Wood" from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to "Alexis Wood" from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



3/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to "Alexis Wood" from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding proposed joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding proposed joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding proposed joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize Review & Edit Joint Notice of 9th Circuit Ruling.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
3/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Conference with AMW regarding joint notice of ruling.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with RAM regarding joint notice of ruling.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza filing joint notice re appeal negotiation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/26/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #86	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50

3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Joint Notice of 9th Circuit Ruling.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/26/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #85	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - notice to counsel of filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - notice to counsel of filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - notice to counsel of filing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - extention of filing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement discussions.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding redlined version of the Joint Notice with Defendant's edits	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding redlined version of the Joint Notice with Defendant's edits	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding redlined version of the Joint Notice with Defendant's edits	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00

3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding redlined version of the Joint Notice with Defendant's edits	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding redlined version of the Joint Notice with Defendant's edits	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding CMC with the judge	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding CMC with the judge	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding CMC with the judge	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza approval to file	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza approval to file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza approval to file	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza confirmation of approval to file	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza confirmation of approval to file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza confirmation of approval to file	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza confirmation of approval to file	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza confirmation of approval to file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Ninth Circ. Decisions	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding approval to file	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding approval to file	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding approval to file	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding approval to file	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding approval to file	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding oral argument	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/27/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding oral argument	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/27/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding oral argument	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

3/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding the arbitration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Eszparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding the arbitration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/29/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding arbitration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/29/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding arbitration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding arbitration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/29/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding arbitration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
3/29/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding District Court's Order regarding arbitration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
3/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
3/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding email to client	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

4/1/2019	Heather Mora	Took message and circulated from Teri Thompson.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/4/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #38	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/4/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculate, draft, and file Bill of Costs	\$ 215.00	1	\$ 215.00
4/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement demand	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/4/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement demand	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/4/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding settlement demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling conference call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/4/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding scheduling conference call	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding document missing from database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding document missing from database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding document missing from database	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding document missing from database	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00



4/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding document missing from database	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/5/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from ca9_ecfnoticing@ca9.uscourts.gov regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Bill of Costs (Form 10)"	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding claims administration proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding claims administration proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Automatic reply: Esparza proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding : Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding : Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/10/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza - proposed joint notice re appeal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Court Mandate re: Costs to Appellant, in the 9th Circuit Court of Appeals.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
4/12/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #87	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from ca9_ecfnoticing@ca9.uscourts.gov regarding 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Mandate Issued"	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Mandate Issued"	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Fwd: 17-17175 Shawn Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. "Mandate Issued"	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with Jeff Topor mediation of matter	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
4/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit Joint Notice re: Parties Intent to Mediate.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
4/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Research regarding mediators.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
4/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza additional data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza additional data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/18/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza additional data	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza additional data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Joint Notice re: Parties Intent to Mediate.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Research regarding potential settlement amount.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
4/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with counsel.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Revise joint notice regarding mediation.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
4/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Research into capitalization of Smartpay and ability to pay.	\$ 525.00	2.3	\$ 1,207.50
4/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Meeting with Ron and Kas regarding mediation strategy.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
4/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with Ron and Alexis regarding mediation strategy.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00

4/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Meeting with Kas and Alexis regarding mediation strategy.	\$ 785.00	1.2	\$ 942.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay press release	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay press release	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding info on smartpay	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Judge Papas' availability for mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Judge Papas' availability for mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding information from expert witness	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding information from expert witness	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding information from expert witness	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding form 8k Current Report	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding: Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared date of Mediation session.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/30/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #88	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

4/30/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza: Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
4/30/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Joint Notice of Intent to Mediate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
4/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Mediation availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
4/30/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Mediation availability	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza: Mediation availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci, Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood Mediation availability	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation availability	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding scheduling mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding scheduling mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation confirmation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared Mediation brief deadlines.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood fromMaureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood fromMaureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Regarding mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron Alexis Wood fromMaureen Tapallaerez regarding Regarding: Mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron <Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood fromMaureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Regarding: mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Maureen Tapalla-Perez, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Mediation confirmation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Maureen Tapalla-Perez Kas Gallucci, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Regarding: Mediation confirmation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email toMaureen Tapalla-Perez, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Regarding: Mediation confirmation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email toMaureen Tapalla-Perez, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Regarding: Mediation Confirmation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Mediation confirmation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Mediation confirmation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation confirmation.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci, Ronald Marron from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron fromMaureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron fromMaureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation confirmation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron , Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation procedures	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci, Ronald Marron , Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez egarding: mediation procedures	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation procedures	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding mediation procedures	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding claims administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding claims administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding claims administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring mediation date	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding calendaring mediation date	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Mediation confirmation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding expert witness fees	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding expert witness fees	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding expert witness fees	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/8/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from maureen@judicategwest.com regarding Mediation Paperwork	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from maureen@judicategwest.com regarding mediation Paperwork	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/8/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from maureen@judicategwest.com regarding Mediation Paperwork	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
5/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding legal research: American Association of Political Consultants, Inc. v. Federal Communications Commission	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding availability of Judge Papas for Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

5/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Patrick Ivie regarding claims administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Patrick Ivie regarding claims administration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Patrick Ivie regarding claims administration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Patrick Ivie Ronald Marron , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding claims administration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
5/17/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding Leasing, Inc. Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
5/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding appellate costs	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
5/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding appellate costs	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

5/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding appellate deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
5/28/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding appellate deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/5/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Court Order re; Mtn for Class Cert.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$	392.50
6/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Reviewed and analyzed Court Order re; Mtn for Class Cert.	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$	517.50
6/5/2019	Kas Gallucci	Reviewed and analyzed Court Order re; Mtn for Class Cert.	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$	262.50
6/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Review order lifting stay and setting case schedule.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
6/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Review Order at Doc. 90.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #90	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
6/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Review order re class cert at doc. No. 89	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #89	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
6/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines / calendared date of pretrial conference, deadline for dispositive motion filing date, date of expert discovery cut off dates, deadlines for reply reports, and Opposition deadlines.	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$	64.50
6/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Review dates for smartpay trial and pretrial.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
6/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Review deadlines and amend according to Doc. No. 90.	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$	107.50
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00

6/6/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/6/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/6/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaminski from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Isam Khoury, Jason Hill , Kas Gallucci , Lilach Halperin, M. Singer , Marta Man, Mike Houchin, Timothy Cohelan from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Isam Khoury, Jason Hill , Kas Gallucci , Lilach Halperin, M. Singer , Marta Man, Mike Houchin, Timothy Cohelan from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Isam Khoury, Jason Hill , Kas Gallucci , Lilach Halperin, M. Singer , Marta Man, Mike Houchin, Timothy Cohelan from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew M. Loker regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Matthew M. Loker from Kas Gallucci regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Matthew M. Loker regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison from Kas Gallucci regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/6/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Allison from Kas Gallucci regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison from Kas Gallucci regarding Order granting class certification	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding parza v. Case Management Scheduling Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/8/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding parza v. Case Management Scheduling Order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Discuss notice plan with AMW.	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
6/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Discuss notice plan with KLG.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00



6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Order Granting Class Certification and Case Schedule	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Order Granting Class Certification and Case Schedule	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kauffman from i from regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kauffman from i from regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. regarding class notice.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	mail to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Calendaring call re: Class Notice Plan	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Review quote for claims notice.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50

6/13/2019	Alexis Wood	T/C with David Kauffman and Alexis Wood at Heffler Claims group re: Notice	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
6/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C with David Kauffman and Alexis Wood at Heffler Claims group re: Notice	\$ 525.00	0.6	\$ 315.00
6/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review order granting in part and denying in part motion for class certification.	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$ 210.00
6/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding call re: Class Notice Plan	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding call re: Class Notice Plan	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/13/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding call re: Class Notice Plan	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence joint motion for certification notice.	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
6/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding cost of class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding cost of class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding cost of class notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/14/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding cost of class notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order Lifting Stay and Setting Case Schedule.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
6/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding legal research - Certification Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Esparza Draft MOU	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding Settlement Demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza Settlement Demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Demand	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/17/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Class Certification	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/17/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Class Certification	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C with Jeff T. re: Class Motion.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Meeting with AW re: Class Notice & claims administrations.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Meeting with KG re: Class Notice & claims administrations.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Prepare Self Mailer Notice.	\$ 525.00	2.1	\$ 1,102.50
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review, edit and draft Joint Motion re: Notice Plan	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$ 367.50
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Review estimate from Dave Kaufman re: mailer for class certification	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert discovery deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding expert discovery deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding egarding expert discovery deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding egarding expert discovery deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring deadlines in scheduling order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring deadlines in scheduling order	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring deadlines in scheduling order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Request for Production of Class Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Request for Production of Class Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring pretrial deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding SmartPay - calendaring	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding calendaring Pretrial Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Confirmation of Case Status Meeting	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding regarding Confirmation of Case Status Meeting	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding regarding Confirmation of Case Status Meeting	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding regarding Confirmation of Case Status Meeting	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	T/C with Dave Kaufman re: Self mailer.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Reviewed and analyzed Notice Quotes.	\$ 525.00	0.9	\$ 472.50
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Research and draft Ps second set of ROG to serve as discovery ending	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$ 1,322.50
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Research and draft Ps fourth set of RPDs to serve as discovery ending	\$ 575.00	3.1	\$ 1,782.50
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taturan from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Zechs Taturan from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Discovery	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Calendaring Discovery Deadlines	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
6/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Calendaring Discovery Deadlines	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
6/19/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Calendaring Discovery Deadlines	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C w/David Kaufman re: website.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$	157.50
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Phone call with AW, re: wording on timing of Dissemination of Notice.	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$	210.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Prepare proposed Order.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$	157.50
6/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Review & Edit notice plan	\$ 575.00	2.3	\$	1,322.50
6/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Motion re: Agreed on Form of Class Notice.	\$ 785.00	0.6	\$	471.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Edit Joint Motion re: Class Notice.	\$ 525.00	0.7	\$	367.50
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review D's edits to Letter Notice.	\$ 525.00	0.4	\$	210.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00



6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding class notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding class notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #91	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Review further edits to joint notice plan by D's counsel.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Review edits from defense counsel regarding final notice plan.	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize and file joint notice plan.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
6/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Ronald Marron regarding proposed notice plan	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding proposed notice plan	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding proposed notice plan	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding proposed notice plan	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion and Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion and Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Motion and Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Motion and Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay Settlement Website	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amendments to Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amendments to Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amendements to Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amendements to Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amendements to Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Motion re Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/21/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Website	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies of Joint Motion	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies of Joint Motion	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/22/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies of Joint Motion	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Courtesy Copies of Joint Motion re: Class Notice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion re: Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/22/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion re: Class Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/24/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #92	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Order Granting Joint Motion Re: Agreed on Form of Class Notice and Plan of Dissemination.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/24/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #94	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
6/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Review order granting form of notice.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
6/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with RAM and KLG regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
6/24/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft errata to Exhibit A to joint notice plan.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
6/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Conference with KLG and AMW regarding settlement.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00
6/24/2019	Kas Gallucci	Conference with RAM and AMW regarding settlement.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of confidential settlement brief re: mediation	\$ 575.00	3.7	\$ 2,127.50
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft amended order re: form of notice	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with Jeff Topor regarding additional data necessary for mediation	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Theresa Hoang regarding Joint Motion re: Class Notice Filing Error	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

6/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies - Notice of Errata	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/25/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies - Notice of Errata	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Notice of Errata	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/25/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Notice of Errata	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to judgepapas@icloud.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Case Documents for 7/11 mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to judgepapas@icloud.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Case Documents for 7/11 mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/25/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to judgepapas@icloud.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing - Case Documents for 7/11 mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding phone call from Jeff Topor	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/25/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding regarding phone call from Jeff Topor	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/25/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding phone call from Jeff Topor	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

6/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amended order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C w/David Kaufman re: Class Notice.	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	T/C with David Kaufman re: Class Notice (2nd phone call).	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding : amended order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amended order re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amended order re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding amended order re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding amended order re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Aslsup from Alexis Wood regarding Amended Order re: Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
6/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Aslsup from Alexis Wood regarding Amended Order re: Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
6/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Aslsup from Alexis Wood regarding Amended Order re: Class Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Review prior expert report in preparation for supplemental report.	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review supplemental data provided by Jeff Topor.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00

7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Research potential class administrators and request quotes for class administration in preparation for mediation .	\$ 575.00	1.6	\$ 920.00
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft joint motion to amend order regarding notice plan.	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
7/2/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #93	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit mediation brief.	\$ 575.00	1.8	\$ 1,035.00
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiff's Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding discovery - Production of Additional Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding discovery - Production of Additional Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding discovery - Production of Additional Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regardingdiscovery - Production of Additional Data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Review and edit Mediation Brief.	\$ 525.00	2.4	\$ 1,260.00
7/3/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit Mediation Brief.	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Draft Request for Admission as discovery closing.	\$ 525.00	1.2	\$ 630.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit requests for admissions	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
7/3/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #95	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50

7/3/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #96	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Confernece with RAM re; prior settlement offer in demand	\$ 525.00	0.5	\$ 262.50
7/3/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Confernece with RAM re; prior settlement offer in demand	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft corresndence to Defendant revoking prior settlement demand offer	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Administration Quotes	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding production of additional data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding production of additional data	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Patrick Ivie from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Patrick Ivie <PIvie@kccllc.com> from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Class Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Teri Thompson from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Teri Thompson from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Production of Additional Data, Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Production of Additional Data, Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Production of Additional Data, Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Production of Additional Data, Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/3/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/3/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/3/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies - Joint Motion to Amend Class Notice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Marili Krejsbo regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Offer	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Offer	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Offer	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Settlement Offer	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Kas Gallucci regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Zechs Taduran from Kas Gallucci regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/4/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Zechs Taduran from Kas Gallucci regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Zechs Taduran regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Zechs Taduran regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/4/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci from Zechs Taduran regarding mailing correspondence	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Expert Report	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to briefs@judicategwest.com, Judge Papas from Alexis Wood regarding Confidential Settlement Brief	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to briefs@judicategwest.com, Judge Papas from Alexis Wood regarding Confidential Settlement Brief	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/4/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to briefs@judicategwest.com, Judge Papas from Alexis Wood regarding Confidential Settlement Brief	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
7/4/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/4/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/4/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendared date deadline for defendant to provide names and addressed for Class Members.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
7/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/6/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition Subpoena-Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #98	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
7/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #97	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50

7/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , "judgepapas@icloud.com" <judgepapas@icloud.com> from "Briefs @ JW" <briefs@judicategwest.com> regarding Confidential Settlement Brief Esparza v. SmartPay Leasing, Inc., No. 3:17-cv-03421- WHA	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/8/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Teri Thompson regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Eric Troutman and Emily Wallerstein's Notice of Appearances and conference with AMW and KLG	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with RAM and KLG re: appearance of new counsel	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Conference with RAM and KLG re: appearance of new counsel	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50

7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft RFA set two.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft subpoena to twilio. Including schedule A	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft subpoena to duc phan. Including schedule A	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Marili Krejsbol regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/9/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald Marron, Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Maureen Tapalla-Perez regarding Claims Administration Proposal	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to jeff@tcpawitness.com from Kas Gallucci regarding new Defense Counsel	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to jeff@tcpawitness.com from Kas Gallucci regarding new Defense Counsele	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding new Defense Counsel	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding new Defense Counsel	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen regarding discovery cutoff	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen <jeff@tcpawitness.com> from Kas Gallucci regarding discovery cutoff	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Fwd: Regarding Claims Administration Quote	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Fwd: Regarding Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Fwd: Regarding Mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiff's Requests for Admissions to Defendant	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen from Kas Gallucci regarding Plaintiff's Requests for Admissions to Defendant	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to maureen@judicategwest.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to maureen@judicategwest.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to maureen@judicategwest.com from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Plaintiff's Requests for Admissions	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Hansen regarding Plaintiff's Requests for Admissions	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/9/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/9/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare for mediation session, including review of relevant case law and prior settlements	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Review Defendant's list of issues regarding expert testimony.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci Smartpay Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Smartpay Discovery for Personal Service	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Request for Admissions	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Plaintiff's Request for Admissions	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding updating counsel on proof of service for discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding updating counsel on proof of service for discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Hansen Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood scheduling of depositions	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood scheduling of depositions	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood scheduling of depositions	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to sjccl@mail.com from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding outstanding discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Notice of Deposition - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regardinService of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Supoena - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Spencer Chase, Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Spencer Chase, Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase, Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email from Spencer Chase to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci, Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email from Spencer Chase to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email from Spencer Chase to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase from Allison Cardwell Twililio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from contact@calwest.info regarding Completed Service - Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from contact@calwest.info regarding Service - Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Cal West Attorney Services regarding Calwest Service - Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Discovery for Mail Service	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding Discovery for Mail Service	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding MOU	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/10/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding MOU	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to travel@aikenwelch.com from Allison Cardwell regarding Depo Scheduling - Twilio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Sservice of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/10/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Spencer Chase <sjccl@mail.com> from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel to mediation.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Travel to mediation.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
7/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Travel to mediation.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50

7/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Attended Mediation with AMW and KG	\$ 785.00	10.5	\$ 8,242.50
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Attended Mediation with AMW and RAM	\$ 525.00	10.5	\$ 5,512.50
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Attended Mediation with RAM and KG	\$ 575.00	10.5	\$ 6,037.50
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Travel from mediation.	\$ 525.00	0.3	\$ 157.50
7/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Travel from mediation.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel from mediation.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Review supplemental list of issues regarding expert testimony.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood,Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Expert Disclosure	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood,Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Defendant's Expert Disclosure	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Experxt Disclosure	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Experxt Disclosure	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron from Kas Gallucci regarding Defendant's Experxt Disclosure	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Expert Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Expert Discovery	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Kas Gallucci , Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Expert Discovery	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Spencer Chase regarding Service of Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Colleen Perry regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Colleen Perry regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Fwd: Confirmation of Scheduling 07/30/2019 117874	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Fwd: Confirmation of Scheduling 07/29/2019 117873	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



7/11/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell Confirmation of Scheduling - Twilio Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Service of Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/11/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci <klgallucci@gmail.com> regarding Mediation Expenses	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Expert Discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci, Ronald Marron from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Reyes v. Lincoln Automotive Financial Services - Legal Research	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci, Ronald Marron from Westlaw@westlaw.com regarding Reyes v. Lincoln Automotive Financial Services - Legal Research	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Matt Gaine regarding Twilio Deposition Subpoena	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Supplemental Document Production	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Supplemental Document Production	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/12/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Supplemental Document Productio	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Deposition Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood , Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Deposition Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Matt Gainer from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Notice - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Matt Gaineregarding Deposition Notice - Twilio	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding research re: subsidiaries	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding research re: subsidiaries	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding research re: subsidiaries	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay press release	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay press release	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Kas Gallucci regarding SmartPay release	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Paps from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Paps from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Paps from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Paps from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Paps from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Papas from Kas Gallucci regarding Draft MOU for Mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Papas from Kas Gallucci regarding Final MOU for Mediation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/12/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Papas from Kas Gallucci regarding Final MOU for Mediation	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Papas from Kas Gallucci regarding Final MOU for Mediation	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/12/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Kas Gallucci regarding Mediation Expenses	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Matt Gainer from Alexis Wood regarding Twilio Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taturan, Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Preliminary Approval Deadline	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Zechs Taturan, Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Preliminary Approval Deadline	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Matt Gainer regarding Twilio Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Marron Ron , Gallucci Kas , Wood Alexis , Troutman Eric , Topor Jeff from Leonidas Papas regarding Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/15/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Marron Ron , Gallucci Kas , Wood Alexis , Troutman Eric , Topor Jeff from Leonidas Papas regarding Settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00

7/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Matt Gainer regarding Twilio Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft withdrawals of deposition notices.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$	172.50
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Review memorandum of understanding	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$	345.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft joint motion of settlement.	\$ 575.00	1.1	\$	632.50
7/18/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Ntc of Settlement & Joint Request to Vacate Case schedule.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$	235.50
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Kas Gallucci regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taturan from Alexis Wood regarding Mail Service - Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Matt Gaine from Alexis Wood regarding Twilio Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taturan regarding Mail Service - Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taturan regarding Mail Service - Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taturan regarding Mail Service - Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taturan regarding Mail Service - Discovery	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/19/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadlines for discovery date of service.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
7/19/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadline to File Motion for Preliminary Approval.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50

7/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	4.6	\$ 2,645.00
7/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/19/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Zechs Taduran, Kas Gallucci from Allison Cardwell regarding Preliminary Approval Deadline	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Shondell Beck regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Kas Gallucci regarding Preliminary Approval Deadline	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/20/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood, Heather Mora from Allison Cardwell regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood, Heather Mora from Allison Cardwell regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Kas Gallucci , Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/20/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Kas Gallucci, Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #99	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/22/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Cancellation of Deposition	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Continue to draft settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	2.4	\$ 1,380.00
7/23/2019	Allison Cardwell	Review order at Doc. No. 100	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

7/23/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendar Doc. No. 100	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/23/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #100	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed Court Order re: Notice of Settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Stip to Vacate & Motion re Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Stip to Vacate & Motion re Class Notice	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/23/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order - Joint Stip to Vacate & Motion re Class Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies of Stipulation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies of Stipulation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: Joint Motion Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Jeff Topor , Kas Gallucci from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Motiion for Settlement	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: Joint Motion Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Courtesy Copies of Stipulation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/23/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding regarding Courtesy Copies of Stipulation	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/23/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Joint Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald A. Marron Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
7/24/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald A. Marron Ronald Marron from Heather Mora regarding Class Certification Order	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/24/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hearing Expenses	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/24/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Hearing Expenses	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with defense counsel regarding settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with claims administrator regarding notice.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding scheduling case status call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding case status call.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding case status call	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Status of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Status of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Status of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Status of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/25/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Status of Discovery	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit drafting settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
7/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit drafting settlement agreement.	\$ 785.00	3.4	\$ 2,669.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/26/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regardin Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$	105.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc.Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood ,Eric Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Call re: draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
7/26/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Call re: SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
7/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with claims administrator/Hefler	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$	287.50
7/29/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendared call with Jeff Topor and AW.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$	21.50
7/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Review settlement in Etter and compare settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	2.1	\$	1,207.50
7/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Call re: draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00

7/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Call re: draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/29/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding call re: draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/29/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding call re: draft settlement agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare binder for upcoming hearing.	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Binder for Hearing on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Binder for Hearing on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/30/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza v. Smartpay Leasing, Inc. Claims Administration Estimate	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Court appearance for hearing regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	2.5	\$ 1,437.50
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel from San Francisco to San Diego after hearing regarding settlement.	\$ 575.00	5.3	\$ 3,047.50
7/31/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated Date of hearing on Motion to Vacate + Hearing to Discuss Settlement Agreement.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
7/31/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Settlement Agreement.	\$ 785.00	1.6	\$ 1,256.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with plaintiff re: settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	1.1	\$ 632.50
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Further review and edit settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to wood.alexismarie@gmail.com from Alexis Wood regarding Binder for Hearing on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Redlined draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to wood.alexismarie@gmail.com from Alexis Wood Redlined draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Redlined draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
7/31/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #101	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/1/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed and analyzed Order Re: Stipulated & Request to Vacate Case Schedule.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
8/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #102	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/1/2019	Allison Cardwell	Review order at Doc. No. 102, Calendar	\$ 215.00	0.3	\$ 64.50
8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Client from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay Update	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Cy Pres Designation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding Cy Pres Designation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/1/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review all discovery and draft outline for confirmatory discovery deposition to be used by RAM.	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
8/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Confirmatory Discovery Deposition and Outstanding Requests	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/2/2019	Kas Gallucci	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza: confirmatory discovery deposition; outstanding discovery requests	\$ 525.00	0.2	\$ 105.00
8/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: confirmatory discovery deposition; outstanding discovery requests	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Edit settlement agreement.	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
8/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft deposition notice for confirmatory discovery deposition	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
8/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Arrange deposition location for confirmatory discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
8/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calculated deadline to Complete Confirmatory Depositions, per Docket 101.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendared deadline to file Motion for Prelim Approval.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/5/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: confirmatory discovery deposition; outstanding discovery requests	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/5/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: confirmatory discovery deposition; outstanding discovery requests	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Discussed Esparza deposition information and strategy with co counsel.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
8/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Discussed travel options on Esparza with paralegal.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
8/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Reviewed travel plans for Esparza deposition.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of notice documents, including long form, postcard and website notice	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
8/6/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit notice documents, including long form, postcard and website notice	\$ 785.00	1.4	\$ 1,099.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Discussed travel options on Esparza with RAM.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Automatic reply: Esparza-SmartPay draft settlement agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Richard Gilbreth, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Richard Gilbreth Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Richard Gilbreth regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Richard Gilbreth, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Richard Gilbreth, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Richard Gilbreth regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell , Richard Gilbreth from Alexis Wood regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell , Richard Gilbreth from Alexis Wood regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from DepoSD DepoSD@sullivanreporters.com regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/6/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell , "Alexis Wood" from Robyn Prosser regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



8/6/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell Alexis Wood from Robyn Prosser regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to DepoSD Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to DepoSD Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell , Alexis Wood from DepoSD egarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell , Alexis Wood from DepoSD regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza: confirmatory discovery deposition; outstanding discovery requests	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Service of Deposition Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Richard Gilbreth , DepoSD from Alexis Wood regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Richard Gilbreth , DepoSD from Alexis Wood regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Robyn Prosser from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Robyn Prosser from Allison Cardwell regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from Robyn Prosser regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Robyn Prosser regarding Video Conference Depo - Esparza v. Smartpay	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Travel Arrangements to Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Travel Arrangements to Deposition	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Travel Arrangements to Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taturan regarding Service of Deposition Notices	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron , Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Deposition - PMQ	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron , Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Deposition - PMQ	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

8/7/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Ronald Marron , Allison Cardwell from Alexis Wood regarding Smartpay Deposition - PMQ	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Deposition of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition of Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition of Paul Cathey	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Litigation Costs	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Draft notice documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/7/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Commence draft of motion for preliminary approval - factual background	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
8/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft of motion for preliminary approval - terms of the settlement	\$ 5,750.00	3.7	\$ 21,275.00
8/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit notice documents, including long form, postcard and website notice	\$ 575.00	1.6	\$ 920.00
8/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Report	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Litigation Expenses	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/8/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to from Helen regarding Confirmation of Scheduling - Paul Cathey Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Client Signature - Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Client Signature - Settlement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Client Signature - Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Can you sent to Shawn Esparza in SmartPay for E signature	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement-- Final.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Hansen from Alexis Wood regarding Expert Witness Fees	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Hansen regarding Expert Witness Fees	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

8/9/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Shawn Esparza , Ronald Marron from "Law Offices of Ronald A. Marron" regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey r	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Binder - Paul Cathey	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Prepared for the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	3.2	\$ 2,512.00
8/12/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Helen regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Class Notice Documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit notice documents.	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Flight to San Francisco for the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	2.7	\$ 2,119.50
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Deposed PMQ Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	1.6	\$ 1,256.00

8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Phone call with AMW about the progress of the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Phone call with AMW about the progress of the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	0.3	\$ 235.50
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Flight from San Francisco to San Diego for the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	2.1	\$ 1,648.50
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Phone call with RAM after the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Phone call with AMW after the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	0.4	\$ 314.00
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Travel from the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 785.00	2.3	\$ 1,805.50
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Phone call with RAM about the progress of the deposition of Smartpay Leasing regarding Confirmatory Discovery.	\$ 575.00	0.1	\$ 57.50
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taduran regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood, Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Richard Gilbreth regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Richard Gilbreth from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Richard Gilbreth from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Richard Gilbreth from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Richard Gilbreth from Heather Mora regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Class List, Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Zechs Taduran from Alexis Wood regarding Deposition Confirmation - Paul Cathey	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Zechs Taduran from Heather Mora regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Zechs Taduran regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00



8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Zechs Taduran from Allison Cardwell regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Zechs Taduran regarding Awaiting Confirmation - ESPARZA V. SMARTPAY LEASING, INC. 08/13/2019 - 81642	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to sanfrancisco.mid@regus.com, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Paul Cathey Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to sanfrancisco.mid@regus.com, Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Paul Cathey Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from SanFrancisco Mid regarding Paul Cathey Deposition	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell, Alexis Wood from SanFrancisco Mid regarding Paul Cathey Deposition	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Continue draft motion for preliminary approval argument section / legal standard and why settlement is fair	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
8/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Conference with AMW prior to the deposition/prep	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference with RAM prior to the deposition/prep	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and revise notice documents re comments from Heffler and defense counsel	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Allison Cardwell from SanFrancisco Mid regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Allison Cardwell from SanFrancisco Mid regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/14/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from SanFrancisco Mid regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza v. SmartPay (Class Notice Documents)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Esparza v. SmartPay (Class Notice Documents)	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Eric J. Troutman regarding Preliminary Approval Order	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Continue draft motion for preliminary approval argument section	\$ 575.00	4.5	\$ 2,587.50
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft supporting declaration of Ronald A Marron in support of motion for preliminary approval, including revision of cv	\$ 575.00	2.7	\$ 1,552.50
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft supporting documents and review all exhibits in support of motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Ronald Marron regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$	43.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Class List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regardinClass List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
8/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Class List	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
8/16/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review & Edit Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement. / review exhibits 1-2.	\$ 785.00	1.7	\$	1,334.50

8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding document edits to table	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding Signed Settlement Agreement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit preliminary approval and cite check all case law and shepardize	\$ 575.00	4.5	\$ 2,587.50
8/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to from Southwest Airlines regarding Alexis Wood's 09/11 Travel Confirmation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Alexis Wood's 09/11 Travel Confirmation	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/17/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Travel Expenses	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Current Lodestar	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Current Lodestar	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft preliminary approval order and finalize approval order	\$ 575.00	3.2	\$ 1,840.00

8/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Review defendant's edits to preliminary approval motion	\$ 575.00	1.5	\$ 862.50
8/19/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit preliminary approval order and finalize approval order	\$ 785.00	2.3	\$ 1,805.50
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Review edit and finalize motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize preliminary approval order	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize final approval order	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize declaration of RAM in support of motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	1.4	\$ 805.00
8/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Prepare Courtesy Copies of Motion for Settlement, Doc. 103	\$ 215.00	0.5	\$ 107.50
8/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Mail Copies of Plaintiff's Motion for Settlement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/20/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #103	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/20/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review and edit notice docs including long form, postcard and website	\$ 785.00	1.7	\$ 1,334.50
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Finalize notice docs including long form, postcard and website	\$ 575.00	1.5	\$ 862.50
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay Preliminary Approval Papers	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding SmartPay Preliminary Approval Papers	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor from Eric J. Troutman regarding SmartPay Preliminary Approval Papers	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from Alexis Wood regarding SmartPay Preliminary Approval Papers	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Current Lodgestar	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

8/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order Granting Plaintiff's Unopposed Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Judge Alsup from Alexis Wood regarding Proposed Order Granting Plaintiff's Unopposed Motion for Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies Preliminary Approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/21/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies Preliminary Approval	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies Preliminary Approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
8/21/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Alexis Wood regarding Courtesy Copies Preliminary Approval	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/24/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/24/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00

8/27/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/28/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/28/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
8/28/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
8/28/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/3/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendar date of Hearing for Motion for Final Approval.	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Draft outline in preparation for hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	3.6	\$ 2,070.00
9/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel to San Fran from San Diego for hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	4.3	\$ 2,472.50
9/11/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Heather Mora from Ronald Marron regarding Motion for Settlement itinerary and other important travel information.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/12/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #104	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare for hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	1.3	\$ 747.50



9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Travel to San Fran from San Diego for hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 785.00	4.1	\$ 3,218.50
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Attend hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	1.2	\$ 690.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Attend hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 785.00	1.2	\$ 942.00
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Travel from San Fran to San Diego re: hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 575.00	4.8	\$ 2,760.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Travel from San Fran to San Diego re: hearing on motion for preliminary approval	\$ 785.00	4.8	\$ 3,768.00
9/12/2019	Heather Mora	Calendar deadlines for Class Notice Distribution / Objections / and Settlement Opt Outs.	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review Court Order re: Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.6	\$ 471.00
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Review Court Order re: Preliminary Approval of Class Action Settlement.	\$ 785.00	0.5	\$ 392.50
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding non-reversionary settlement fund	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding non-reversionary settlement fund	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding non-reversionary settlement fund	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/12/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/12/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/12/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/12/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Ronald A. Marron, Alexis Wood from Heather Mora regarding Motion for Settlement Hearing	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Prepare documents for class administration and prepare class list	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kauffman from regarding Order Granting Preliminary Approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to from regarding Calendaring Deadlines in Order on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to from regarding Calendaring Deadlines in Order on Motion for Settlement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Calendaring Deadlines in Order on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Calendaring Deadlines in Order on Motion for Settlement	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Calendaring Deadlines in Order on Motion for Settlement	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Class Administration	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding Class Administration	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Preliminary approval granted	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$	115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$	157.00

9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron from Jeff Topor regarding operative complaint	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/13/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Smartpay / Order re Prelim Approval	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/13/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Allison Cardwell from Heather Mora regarding Smartpay / Order re Prelim Approval	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class List	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Shawn Esparza from Alexis Wood regarding Order Granting Preliminary Approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/13/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding CAFA Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email from Alexis Wood to Jeff Topor and Eric Troutman re: CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Edit notice documents to include court ordered dates	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
9/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Data	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regardinng CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Jeff Topor regarding CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Download and save docket #105	\$ 215.00	0.1	\$ 21.50
9/18/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Review Set Court Notice of Final Approval Hearing date.	\$ 785.00	0.1	\$ 78.50
9/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Calendar Doc. 105	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/18/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Calendaring Deadlines re: Fee Motion and Final Approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/18/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood from Allison Cardwell regarding Calendaring Deadlines re: Fee Motion and Final Approval	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza - CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Esparza - CAFA Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric Troutman, David Kauffman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Notice Documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric Troutman, David Kauffman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Notice Documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

9/19/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Eric Troutman, David Kauffman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Notice Documents	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/21/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from David Kaufman regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/21/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from David Kaufman regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/22/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from David Kaufman regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/22/2019	Allison Cardwell	Email to Alexis Wood , Eric J. Troutman, Jeff Topor from David Kaufman regarding Esparza -- CAFA notice	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Exclusions	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Exclusions	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
9/26/2019	Heather Mora	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Exclusions	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
9/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Opt Outs	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Opt Outs	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/26/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Opt Outs	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
9/26/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman from Heather Mora regarding Notice Documents	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

9/26/2019	Heather Mora	Email to David Kaufman from Heather Mora regarding Notice Documents	\$ 215.00	0.2	\$ 43.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit postcard notice prior to sending to Heffler re: typos	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit long form notice prior to sending to Heffler re: typos	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit postcard notice re: edits from Heffler	\$ 575.00	0.6	\$ 345.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit long form notice re: edits from Heffler	\$ 575.00	0.8	\$ 460.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Postcard Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding postcard notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding postcard notice for review and approval	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding postcard notice for review and approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding postcard notice for review and approval	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding Edits to Postcard Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00



10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding regarding Edits to Postcard Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding regarding Edits to Postcard Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding regarding Edits to Postcard Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding Long form Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/2/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood , David Kaufman, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding Long form Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/2/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Esparza -- Long Form Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- Long Form Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding Esparza -- Long Form Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

10/3/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor from David Kaufman <dkaufman@hefflerclaims.com> regarding Esparza -- Long Form Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/3/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor from David Kaufman <dkaufman@hefflerclaims.com> regarding Esparza -- Long Form Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Review and edit IVR recording re: notice	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Review link to staging website and confirm if approved	\$ 575.00	0.9	\$ 517.50
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Review Ds staging to staging website	\$ 575.00	0.3	\$ 172.50
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/8/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/8/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/8/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding IVR script for review and approval	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/8/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding proposed edits to IVR script	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/8/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Jeff Topor regarding proposed edits to IVR script	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding proposed edits to IVR script.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood , Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding proposed edits to IVR script.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding incorporating the suggested edits to the IVR script.	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/9/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding incorporating the suggested edits to the IVR script.	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Edits to IVR Script	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Edits to IVR Script	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/9/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Jeff Topor, Alexis Wood, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Edits to IVR Script	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/10/2019	Alexis Wood	Work with Heffler to make sure notice is provided to class by October 16	\$ 575.00	0.7	\$ 402.50
10/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/11/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman from Alexis Wood regarding having Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/14/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/14/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00

10/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from David Kaufman regarding Settlement Website	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/15/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/15/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron , Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Website	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Website	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/16/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Settlement Website	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/16/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Postcard Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00
10/16/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to David Kaufman, Jeff Topor, Ronald Marron, Eric J. Troutman from Alexis Wood regarding Postcard Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
10/17/2019	Alexis Wood	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Notice	\$ 575.00	0.2	\$ 115.00

10/17/2019	Ronald A. Marron	Email to Alexis Wood from David Kaufman regarding Class Notice	\$ 785.00	0.2	\$ 157.00
11/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Conference call with Heffler re: status of notice	\$ 575.00	0.5	\$ 287.50
11/20/2019	Alexis Wood	Review declaration of Heffler re: status of notice	\$ 575.00	0.4	\$ 230.00
<b>TOTAL</b>					<b>\$ 914,301.50</b>